
Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

Fwd: Sensor price
2 messages

Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> 2 May 2025 at 11:21
To: Kate Griffitths <kate.griffiths@vmsecure.me.uk>

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: Hamish Wyllie (NHS Highland) <hamish.wyllie@nhs.scot>
Date: Fri, 2 May 2025 at 11:21
Subject: Sensor price
To: info@viamed.co.uk <info@viamed.co.uk>

Hi folks

Can you please give us a price for a R-23V sensor, Ref 0110023?

Please advise of carriage costs

Thank you

Hamish

Hamish Wyllie

Specialist Clinical Technologist

NHS Highland
Electromedical Equipment Services
Dept of Medical Physics & Bio-Engineering, Zone 2
Raigmore Hospital, Old Perth Road
Inverness,  IV2 3UJ
Telephone: 01463 704276 

Email: hamish.wyllie@nhs.scot 

Section Email: nhsh.eesraigmore@nhs.scot 

Repair Request Form:  QF003 - Medical Equipment Work Request Form.pdf (scot.nhs.uk)

How am I doing? Please feel free to provide feedback to my manager at michael.nicolson2@nhs.scot
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