4/28/25, 9:10 AM Gmail - Re: Oxygen sensor R-22med

N‘ Gmall Agib Majeed <viamed.aqib.majeed2@gmail.com>

Re: Oxygen sensor R-22med

Vagelis Rousopoulos <vrousso@gmail.com> Sun, Apr 27, 2025 at 3:14 PM
To: Agib Majeed <aqib.majeed@viamed.co.uk>

Hi again from Greece
Would you please send me one more

Teledyne Oxygen Sensor R-26MED

Just only you have to send it to a new address in UK. And you will charge me again with the same way charging my visa or any other way that you prefer.
The posting address is

Christos Mitsios
21 Sherwood court Chatfield RD, London, SW11 3UY, UK

phone number +306983766253
and please try to send it untill wednesday because he is coming to Greece to take it with him.

Thanks looking forward for your replay

Vagelis Rousopoulos
BSc.,M.Sc. & Ph.D. Sports and Exercise Science
mob:00306973023277
e-mail:vrousso@gmail.com
On 20 May 2024, at 1:44, Agib Majeed <agib.majeed@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Hello
Good morning
Thank you for your order.
Please see attached below for your proforma invoice detailing the product you require including carriage costs.

Can you please confirm how you would like to make payment?

If you could also have a look and see if all the details are correct including the invoicing and shipping address.

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=18de0f2fa7&view=pt&search=all&permmsgid=msg-f:1830565463919993593&simpl=msg-f: 1830565463919993593 1/6
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This proforma invoice is valid for 30 days.
Please let me know how you would like to make payment.
Kind regards

Aqgib Majeed
Office Administrator
Viamed Ltd.

http://www.viamed.co.uk

email: agib.majeed@viamed.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

Please note: Viamed is enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone calls to the main office
will be answered, but please continue to use email where possible.

E-mail Disclaimer

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

Itis intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and
may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44
(0)1535 634542

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Mon, 20 May 2024 at 09:44, Vagelis Rousopoulos <vrousso@gmail.com> wrote:
Hi Kate
| hope everything is ok
Could you please send me a proforma for 1 oxygen sensors R-22med

Vagelis Rousopoulos

BSc.,M.Sc. & Ph.D. Sports and Exercise Science
mob:00306973023277
e-mail:vrousso@gmail.com

On 19 Jul 2023, at 12:15, Aqgib Majeed <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
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https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=18de0f2fa7&view=pt&search=all&permmsgid=msg-f:1830565463919993593&simpl=msg-f: 1830565463919993593

Hello
Good morning
Yes, sorry | just seen it now.

| will convert you proforma invoice to an order now.

We will make you aware once we dispatch your order.

Kind regards

Aqib Majeed
Office Administrator
Viamed Ltd.

http://www.viamed.co.uk

email: agib.majeed@viamed.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

Please note: Viamed is enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone calls to

Gmail - Re: Oxygen sensor R-22med

the main office will be answered, but please continue to use email where possible.

E-mail Disclaimer

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.
It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is

prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the

subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Wed, 19 Jul 2023 at 09:49, Vagelis Rousopoulos <vrousso@gmail.com> wrote:

Hi good morning. Have you seen my payment?

Vagelis Rousopoulos
BSc.,M.Sc. & Ph.D. Sports and Exercise Science
mob:00306973023277

3/6



4/28/25, 9:10 AM

Gmail - Re: Oxygen sensor R-22med

e-mail:vrousso@gmail.com

On 14 Jul 2023, at 1:29, Agib Majeed <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Hello

Good morning

That is fine.

Kind regards

Aqib Majeed
Office Administrator
Viamed Ltd.

http://www.viamed.co.uk

email: agib.majeed@viamed.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

Please note: Viamed is enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office.
Telephone calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use email where possible.

E-mail Disclaimer

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

Itis intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in
reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with
delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Fri, 14 Jul 2023 at 11:28, Vagelis Rousopoulos <vrousso@gmail.com> wrote:
Yes thats correct thank you.
| will pay now with paypal 67,03

Vagelis Rousopoulos

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=18de0f2fa7&view=pt&search=all&permmsgid=msg-f:1830565463919993593&simpl=msg-f: 1830565463919993593

4/6



4/28/25, 9:10 AM Gmail - Re: Oxygen sensor R-22med

BSc.,M.Sc. & Ph.D. Sports and Exercise Science
mob:00306973023277
e-mail:vrousso@gmail.com

On 14 Jul 2023, at 12:58, Aqib Majeed <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Hello

Good morning

Thank you for your request.

Please see attached below for your proforma invoice detailing the prices and product you require
including shipping costs.

Please have a look and see if all details on the proforma invoice are correct or if any amendments
are required.

If you are happy with the proforma and would like to proceed, can you please make payment.
Do let me know you require any further assistance please just ask.
Kind regards

Aqib Majeed
Office Administrator
Viamed Ltd.

http://www.viamed.co.uk

email: agib.majeed@viamed.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

Please note: Viamed is enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and
in the office. Telephone calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use email
where possible.

E-mail Disclaimer

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or
omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.
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If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list,
please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy
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