4/8/25, 10:00 AM Gmail - Re: [Request ID :##431797##): Re: Official Purchase Order from South Warwickshire NHS Foundation Trust - 120114575
l v ' G| | |a|| Agib Majeed <viamed.aqib.majeed2@gmail.com>

Re: [Request ID :##431797##]: Re: Official Purchase Order from South Warwickshire NHS Foundation Trust -
120114575

Purchasing and Supply <PurchasingandSupply@swft.nhs.uk> Tue, Apr 8, 2025 at 9:58 AM
To: agib.majeed@viamed.co.uk
Cc: purchasingandsupply@swft.nhs.uk

Hi Aqib

| have amended the Po with the right price on it.

Regards,

JoJo
Foundation Group Shared Services - Procurement

Description:
Hello

Good afternoon
Thank you for your order,

I am currently processing this now but need to make you aware you have the incorrect price for the product you require, the correct prices for
the EyeMax Phototherapy Masks are as follows:

1114005 - Regular (Blue) - Pack of 20 = £56.70
1114006 - Premie (Orange) - Pack of 20 = £56.70
1114007 - Micro (Green) - Pack of 20 = £56.70
All sizes are priced the same.

EyeMax 2 Postage charges:

1 pack: £8.00

2 - 4 packs: £10.00

5+ packs: £12.00

All prices exclude VAT.

Please can you let me know if you are happy for us to proceed with your order with the price of £56.70 each?
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Kind regards

Aqib Majeed
Office Administrator
Viamed Ltd.

http://www.viamed.co.uk [viamed.co.uk]
email: agib.majeed@viamed.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd [twitter.com]
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

Please note: Viamed is enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone calls to the main office will be
answered, but please continue to use email where possible.

E-mail Disclaimer

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

Itis intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be
unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535
634542

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy [viamed.co.uk]

On Mon, Apr 7, 2025 at 3:45 PM Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> wrote:

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: <swft.integra@nhs.net>

Date: Mon, 7 Apr 2025 at 15:43

Subject: Official Purchase Order from South Warwickshire NHS Foundation Trust - 120114575
To: <sales@viamed.co.uk>, <orders@viamed.co.uk>

Please find attached a Purchase Order from South Warwickshire NHS Foundation Trust for goods/services to be provided by Viamed.
Please view the attachment for details of the goods/services required.

When submitting invoices for payment, please ensure to use the email address shown on the purchase order.

*** PLEASE DO NOT REPLY TO THIS EMAIL AS THE EMAIL BOX IS UNMONITORED, PLEASE USE THE DETAILS SHOWN ON THE PURCHASE ORDER
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*kk

Thank You
Procurement Department

Regards,

To help us improve your local health service and make sure our hospitals and community services are meeting your needs, please click
https://www.swft.nhs.uk/join-us/become-member to become a member. This email has been scanned for viruses; however we are unable to accept responsibility for
any damage caused by the contents. The opinions expressed in this email represent the views of the sender, not South Warwickshire NHS Foundation Trust unless
explicitly stated. If you have received this email in error please notify the sender. The information contained in this email may be subject to public disclosure under
the NHS Code of Openness or the Freedom of Information Act 2000. Unless the information is legally exempt from disclosure, the confidentiality of this e-mail and
your reply cannot be guaranteed. Where applicable, all emails to and from you and/or your representatives may form part of your record. Any personal information
that is processed by the Trust is done so in accordance with the Data Protection Act 2018.
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