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M Gma" Ryan Swaine <viamed.ryan.swaine@gmail.com>

Re: inquiry : sensor + sensors for sticks to add
1 message

Subcompresseur <subcompresseur@wanadoo.fr> 2 April 2025 at 07:36
To: ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk

Good morning,
we are thanking for your last message and we please you to add to your proforma invoice the following items :
* 2 sensors, reference R-17VAN (0110217) for sticks
Awaiting your refreshed proforma invoice and the payment link to settle down the payment
Best regards
Mr M. ORMAYER
Le 01/04/2025 a 12:31, Ryan Swaine a écrit :
Hi
Please find your proforma invoice attached and your payment link below:
https://app.squareup.com/pay-invoice/inv:0-ChB1FIVKCykF7Tt-scud4J4eEIgN
The R-33DE sensors are available from stock for immediate shipping.
Kind regards
Ryan

Ryan Swaine

General Manager

VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk

Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900

Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

On Tue, 1 Apr 2025 at 10:50, Subcompresseur <subcompresseur@wanadoo.fr> wrote:
Hi,

Thank you for your quick reponse, we please you to transmit us your best offer of price and delay for the supply
of:

- 1 piece: sensor your reference R-33DE
delivered to France

Many thanks in advance,

Mr M. ORMAYER

Le 01/04/2025 a 11:29, Ryan Swaine a écrit :
Hi
Thank you, | can confirm the sensor you need is the R-33DE.
Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine
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General Manager

VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk

Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900

Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

On Tue, 1 Apr 2025 at 10:13, Subcompresseur <subcompresseur@wanadoo.fr> wrote:
Dear sirs,

Thank you for this information. Please find attached a photo of our analysor and the sensor, so
we can get your feedback on the model we need.

Many thanks in advance.

Mr. M. ORMAYER

Le 28/03/2025 a 16:24, Ryan Swaine a écrit :

Dear Mr. M Ormayer
Thank you for your email.

The sensor normally used in the O2Ell is the R-33DE (analox 9100-9220-9B), but
there are some early models (18+ years old) that use the R-22DEM, | am not
familiar with the analox part number, as they have stopped supplying them. Please
can you take a look at the attached pictures and confirm which model you require?

Best regards
Ryan

Ryan Swaine

General Manager

VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk

Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900

Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

On Fri, 28 Mar 2025 at 15:19, Subcompresseur <subcompresseur@wanadoo.fr>
wrote:

Dear sirs,

we please you to transmit us your best offer of price and delay for the supply of :

- 1 piece 02EIll SENSOR, reference K1716003, 819767
(pour ANALOX 9212-211-05)

delivered to France

Many thanks in advance

Mr M. ORMAYER
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