28/03/2025, 12:11 Gmail - Re: Order ATAL 250039

M Gma" Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

Re: Order ATAL 250039

1 message

Ales Lenker <lenker@atal.cz> 28 March 2025 at 12:10
To: Kate Giriffiths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>

Dear Kate,

thank you for reminding me.
| agree with the price again.
Thank you

S pozdravem / Best regards
AleS Lenker

nakupni oddéleni
(purchasing department)

ATAL s.r.o.
Lesni 47, Tabor-Horky, 390 01
Ceska republika

e-mail: lenker@atal.cz
Tel.:+420 381 410 141
Mobil: +420 739 527 510

Tel: +420 381 410 100 (spojovatelka / switch board)

web: www.atal.cz
web: www.diag4bike.com

l# https://www.atal.cz
Dne 28.03.2025 v 12:55 Kate Griffiths napsal(a):

Good morning,

Just a quick email to ask if you agree pricing?
Many thanks.

Kind regards

Kate Griffiths

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office.
Telephone calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use email where possible.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted
to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.
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28/03/2025, 12:11 Gmail - Re: Order ATAL 250039

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please
reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Wed, 26 Mar 2025 at 10:16, Kate Giriffiths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Thank you Ales,

Please see snip below for pricing. The carriage will be added at time of invoice as usual. Do you
agree the pricing?

O NO: 251 SBHUIULY
Contact Name : Ales Lenker

Delivery Address Invoice Address Contact Tel :420361410121
ATAL s.ro ATAL Sr.o.
Lesni 47 Lesni 47 Account 00006059
Lﬂ?‘:" La'?"?f Customer Reference 250039
orky orky
380 01 380 01 Da [e‘ 26 Mar 2025
Czech Republic Czech Republic Priarity 3
VAT CZ47216719
Priced In US Dollars
Order Confirmation CVM155871 Page 1

CIP Carriage and Insurance Paid To Atal Sro, Czech Republic * Incoterms(R) 2020
Your Viamed Contact for this Order Confirmation : kate. griffiths@viamed co.uk
Item Reference Description Quantity Unit Unit Vat Total
0110122 Automotive Oxygen Sensor R-22A 100 2780 2.780.00

Tariff 9027109000
CoO United States

Bank Charges Bank Charges 1 30.00 30.00
INS Insurance 1 2780 27.80
PPUPS6 UPS Courier Delivery - Standard 1 0.00 0.00

Total Net: 2,837.80
Total Vat: 0.00
Total: 2,837.80

Many thanks.
Kind regards
Kate Griffiths

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the
office. Telephone calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use email where
possible.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or
omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list,
please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Wed, 26 Mar 2025 at 10:03, Ales$ Lenker <lenker@atal.cz> wrote:

Dear Kate,
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Gmail - Re: Order ATAL 250039
please send my order in the next week.

Thanks.

S pozdravem / Best regards
Ale$ Lenker

nakupni oddéleni
(purchasing department)

ATAL s.r.o.

Lesni 47, Tabor-Horky, 390 01
Ceska republika

e-mail: lenker@atal.cz

web: www.atal.cz
web: www.diag4bike.com

|4 https://www.atal.cz
Dne 26.03.2025 v 10:49 Kate Giriffiths napsal(a):

Good morning Ales,

Thank you for your order.

| can see that your order says 14 weeks. Do you require the delivery date to be in 14

weeks time? ie. early July?

Delivery date: 14week

Many thanks.

Kind regards

Kate Griffiths
http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work

remotely and in the office. Telephone calls to the main office will be answered, but

please continue to use email where possible.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is
unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any
action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be
unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our
mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Wed, 26 Mar 2025 at 09:38, Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> wrote:
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Gmail - Re: Order ATAL 250039

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: Ales Lenker <lenker@atal.cz>
Date: Wed, 26 Mar 2025 at 09:32
Subject: Order ATAL 250039

To: <orders@viamed.co.uk>

Cc: <lenker@atal.cz>

Hello.

I'm sending you order. Please confirmation.
Thank you.

Best regards

Ale$ Lenker

purchasing department

ATAL s.r.o.

Lesni 47,

Tabor-Horky, 390 01

Czech Republic

e-mail: lenker@atal.cz

web: www.atal.cz
web: www.diag4bike.com
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