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| - Abbey End 212 . . AL A
| Keniworth United Kingdom CV8 1ED ?. |l i
bl Cqstqmer Care

| |
Vo
! :

Hotol Front Desk: 441926855957

| c.alln cost 13p per minute plus your phone company‘l R
. access charge. Calls from mobiles will be hbhﬂ‘ Property Overview
.,Emam mail@hi-kenilworth.com ' |

]
'

; HO"day Inn Kenllworth Warvwck il e Modif&Reservation it
.Gunt Name: Ryan Swaine 7 _ ' Do@Wnlo.'a d the IHG App

Checkln:  CheckOut: Rooms: Adults: 0

28 Fqb 2025 — 02 Mar 2026 2 2

| , Cancel Reservation
1 1D 00 11:00

] ] i ! |
1] ) J‘}‘ ) ! : .
i 4 ‘L, : )
‘ | | | | ’

Your confirmation number is: 28279543 Select your preferences before
| your stay
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Invoice #AAF374

Sold byt Billing Address
i

Eventex F\frnlture Ltd VANDAGRAPH Ltd

Unit 2 Ma le Leaf Industrial Est., Bloxwich 15 Station Road
Lane, WaI;all West Mids (with natlonW|de

hubs) BD20 7DT

VAT # GB607145754

WS2 BTH i

VAT # 125434832 ( Q‘/) CQ

| p Cf y\ illvery Details
i [ @tand 646
1 (ﬁ/ O‘\B
R VANDAGRAPH Ltd

NAEC Stoneleigh

Stoneleigh

, Ei ormation
| |

" ORDER DATE 09/01/2025
2 ORDER NUMBER #1736434542332 :
(INVOICE/NUMBER #AAF374 =

.
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3:41 Gmail - Fwd: Jan 23, 2025 bill for Vandagraph

Gmail | helen lamb <viamed.helen.lamb@gmail.com>

" Fwd: Jad, 3, 2025 bill for Vandagraph

1 message |

Kryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk> 23 January 2025 at 09:18

swame@vandagraph co.uk
o <helen.lamb@vandagraph.co.uk>

Ryan SWQI
Reply-To:
To: helen la

2
’ J

Ryan Swai |
General M

VANDAC |n

http/ m hindagraph.co.uk
waine@vandagraph.co.uk

Tel +44 (0 535 634900

Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

ager
H Ltd.

Forwarded message
From: Shopify Billing <billing@shopify.com>
Date: Thu, 23 Jan 2025 at 07:48

Subject: Jan 23, 2025 bill for Vandagraph

To: <info@vandagraph.co.uk>

\
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f bonkumnik=a624e14eae&wew=pt&seamn=a||&penmmd=mmd-t1822030738184136574&simp|=msg-f:1azona733134... 172




1584
Gmail - Fwd: Jan 23, 2025 bill for Vandagraph |
r 2 N |
You've been charged for your bill. |
Your Shopify store, Vandagraph, has been charged. £228.00 GBP has |
been taken from your PayPal account. |
I
BILLING CYCLE: JAN 23, 2025 | ’ |
1
Subscription £228.00 GBP |
|
}
Subtotal £228.00 GBP |
PayPal (viamedpay@viamed.co.uk) -£228.00 GBP |
Total due £0.00 GBP 11§ !
Primary payment method [ P | viamedpay@viamed.co.uk J
Timeline 10
!
23 JAN 2025 |
Primary payment method successful |
{1111 - f
i
| ”. F . Learn more about your bills. |
| !
I "h | . ” !
!
il A shopify 1:
HER R 11 1]
it shopify |
i } 151 O'Connor Street, Ground floor, Ottawa, ON, K2P 2L.8
m |
HE : : I t
A | i
g )
 5 !
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| |
] |
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Printed.com
2 Arcot Court

Cramlington
aberland, NE23 1BB

| Display Boards

| DELIVERY

All produgts
unless othe
!

|
Your pa

{ill! IVAT Analysis
1Code
1

01670 432 067
|| {finance@printed.com
11621 1416 90

Goods
29.25

g -— w‘**

No Paper (Direct to Media) | 25302665

Rate VAT
20.00 5.85

Intified above as FSC are covered by our certification number SA-COC-002357
ise stated.

&fit has been successfully processed.

The Printed Group Limited t/a Printed.com,

INVOICE

Invoice No.
Invoice Date
Account No.

Order No.

1

Goods

VAT

Total

P AlD} Aprinted.com
. N'

PDC02787842

01/02/2
A09533

25
$

2787842

23.2600
5.9900

’ | tered in England Company No 2356130  Registered Office 2 Arcot Court, Cramlington, Northumberiand, NE2

|
|




Tel: | 01670 432 067 INVOICE

Email: finance@printed.com
VAT Reg: 621 1416 90

Invoice To: Invoice No. PDC02813824
Vandagraph Ltd. i
Catrin HO"II"IQS Invoice Date 13/02/2025

15 Station Road Account No. A0953363
Cross Hills |
Keighley Order No. 2813824

United Kingdom, BD20 7DT

|

|

.l

i1

3

]

| | ll t'
; {
!

| isplay Boards No Paper (Direct to Media)
play Boards No Paper (Direct to Media)
]Il blay Boards No Paper (Direct to Media)
| iU splay Boards No Paper (Direct to Media)

28022418
28015759
28015572
25102804

VAT Analysis
Code Goods Rate VAT £123.59
1 123.59 20.00 24.71

£24.71

ntiﬂed above as FSC are covered by our certification number SA-COC-002357
3 stated.

!
unless othe “',

£148.30

: t has been successfully processed.

The Printed Group Limited t/a Printed.com, |
gistered in England Company No 2356130 Registered Office 2 Arcot Court, Cramlington, Northumberiand, NE2 3 |




INVOICE Unit 9 Wi " Way
#5811624
M:I.7 1EH

VAT No: GB677635487

;
i

e N e B L o

SOLD 'l’Ol SHIP TO:

Vlndlgup}l Vandagraph
Ryan swum Ryan Swaine
20 uym Fields 20 Laycock Fields

Cowun@ | Cowling
Keighjeyy BD22 ODN Keighley, BD22 ODN
Intidom United Kingdom |

™1 I*
0780 ! ‘.
il

Pead et

smbroldery Applicat -y % £5.50 £22.00
f The Loom Premium 100% Cotton Pique Polo - 63218  BESTSELL R 20% E11.95 £47.80
i |

lAthloﬂcHelthor

117 #5811624

4 x

Sub-Total: £69.80
Express Dispatch (Dispatched within 4 working days): £17.75
VAT: £17.51
Total: £105.06
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26/02/2025, 1€

Gmail - Dive exhibition |
|
ail helen lamb <viamed.helen.lamb ﬂd\all.com>
Dive exhibition |
1 message
Steve Hardaker <stegoat@hotmail.com> 26 February 2025 at 15:27

To: "helen. Iamb@vnamed co.uk" <helen.lamb@yviamed.co.uk>

Hi Helen

| ; |
It's the dl\}e exhibition this weekend, | will be going down with Ryan on Friday morning, coming back Sunday evening.
I've got cdver for the kids but couldn't for the cats, so Ryan said that Derek agreed to pay to put them in a cattery for 4
days. Not sure if that means Vandagraph or Viamed but will leave that with you.

i

I've booke_d ﬁ'aem in, but can't pay by card, it needs to be a bank transfer. The details are below. Can you please
arrange for this to be paid before Friday morning?

Thanks il
StevelH i |

A |
m.' fletcher <oakworthcattery@yehoo com> e

Sent.. :, sday, February 25, 2025 10:21:29 am 1
To: steghat@hotmail.com <stegoat@hotmail.com> 1
Subj 0 kworth Cattery A

1
0

Hi Steval | i 1]
Hereis il
11a ::‘ "

our confirmation that | have reserved a large double room for Benji & Smudge from Fllléay 9:15-

th February, until Mopday-3rd.March 9:15-11am or 4-6pm collection. ,,
The t; tal for their stay will bg'£86 inc vat) i
, e SO paymeént is by cash or bank transfer to: ;/

Oakworth cattery M >
Broadhead Lane 4 7 5
Keighley M
BD22 0QN 8 é ~ 1040
01535 644488

VAT number 466 4 -

il /] o Q§WY’//?~ !
i

i I
[ 2 < Dobcvs (e :
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Invoice To VANDAGRAPH Ltd Invoice Details

Invoice No : INV-5039
Invoice Date : 01 Apr 2025
Due Date : 01 Apr 2025
VAT Number : 260482415

Description Unit Price | Qty Price

" Go Diving Show, UK, Issue , Comer 3x3 (95QM) 974.25 100 974.25

- 50% Deposit 4€" To secure your stand location and qualify for ‘ 0.00 100 | 0.00
the 10% discount, your deposit must be paid on time. : : -

Subtotal GBP 974.25
VAT 20% GBP 194.85

Total GBP GgP 1,169.10

Payment Instructions

Pound Sterling Australian Dollars

Account Holder : Rork Media Limited Account Holder : Rork Media Limited

Sort Code : 20-11-43 BSB Code : 774001

Account Number : 23670724 Account Number : 201581276

IBAN : GB91 BUKB 2011 4323 670724 Account Type : Checking

SWIFT/BIC : BUKBGB22 SWIFT/BIC : TRWIAUS1XXX

Bank Name . Barclays Bank, 1 Churchill Place, Bank Name : Wise Australia Pty Ltd, Suite 1, Level 11,
London E14 SHP 66 Goulburn Street, Sydney, 2000, Australia

US Dollars Euros

Account Holder : Rork Media Limited Account Holder : Rork Media Limited

Routing Number : 026073150 BIC . TRWIBEB1XXX

Account Number : 8310005957 IBAN : BE37 9670 1792 2128

Account Type : Checking Bank Name : Wise, Rue du Tréne 100, 3™ floor,
SWIFT/BIC : CMFGUS33 ' Brussels, 1050, Belgium

Bank Name : Community Federal Savings Bank, 89-16

Jamaica Ave, Woodhaven NY 11421, United States

09\(/ c\/fﬁj\\

\

OUR GLOBAL BRANDS

) scuea oiver DIVERI[a/

The Biggest Online Resource for Scuba Divers

Rork Media Limited - 71-75 Shelton Street, Covent Garden, London, England, WC2H 9)Q - m.m[kmﬁdnbgm




Holiday Inn Kenilworth - Warwick

212 Abbey End
Kenilworth
CV8 1ED

Great Britain

Tel:+44 (0) 1926 855 957 Holiday Inn

Fax:+44 (0) 1926 855 952 AN IHG' HOTEL
E-mail: mail@hi-kenilworth.com

Web: http://www.bgam.co.uk

Invoice

Ryan Swaine Room No. . 418

20 Lgycock Fields Aavia . 28/02/25
Cowling

Keighley Cowling North Yorkshire Departure . 02/03/25
Great Britain Reference

Folio Number

Cashier . 35/ AFO01

VAT # : 918 0213 50

Page  FOF2
Company: Date . 02/03/25
Group:

Information Copy
IHG Rewards: PC 390190553

Date Description Charges Payments

£ £

28/02/25 Deposit Transfer at Check-In 270.41
28/02/25 Cafe & Bistro Beverage Room# 418 : CHECK# 8351 10.44
28/02/25 *Accommodation (Inclusive VAT) 109.06
01/03/25 *Accommodation (Inclusive VAT) 161.35

02/03/25 MasterCard XXXXXXXXXXXXK6124 70.44

02/03/25 MasterCard XXXXXXXXXXXX6124 -60.00

Total Balance Due £ 0.00

VAT Breakdown

Net £ VAT E£ Grosst

VAT@ 20% 234.04 46.81 280.85
VAT@ 12.5% 0.00 0.00 0.00
VAT@ 5% 0.00 0.00 0.00
VAT@ 4% 0.00 0.00 0.00
VAT@ 2.5% 0.00 0.00 0.00
VAT@ 1% 0.00 0.00 0.00
VAT@ 0% 0.00 0.00 0.00
VAT Exempt 0.00 0.00 0.00
Total 280.85
Signature:

This hotel is Owned by Khanna Enterprises (Kenilworth) Ltd (05948357) under licence from IHG Hotels Ltd
Registered Office: Greenhill House, 90/93 Cowcross Street, London, EC1M 6BF
Company Registration Number: 05948357 VAT No: 918 0213 50




Holiday Inn Kenilworth - Warwick

212 Abbey End

Kenilworth

CVv8 1ED

Great Britain

Tel:+44 (0) 1926 855 957
Fax:+44 (0) 1926 855 952
E-mail: mail@hi-kenilworth.com

Web: http://www.bgam.co.uk

Invoice

Ryan Swaine

20 Laycock Fields

Cowling

Keighley Cowling North Yorkshire
Great Britain

Company:
Group:
IHG Rewards: PC 390190553

Room No.
Arrival
Departure

Reference

Holiday Inn

AN IHG'HOTEL

: 418
. 28/02/25
. 02/03/25

Folio Number

Cashier
VAT #

Page
Date

. 39/ AF01
- 918 0213 50

b OF &
: 02/03/25

Information Copy

Date Description

Credit Card Transaction Details
Credit Card Number: XOOOOOOOXXXXX6124

Expiry Date: XX/XX
Transaction ID: 43904001

Credit Card Transaction Details

Credit Card Number: 1 $.9.9.9.9.9.9.9.0.0.6.(CapL
Expiry Date: XX/IXX

Transaction ID: 43904001

Signature:

This hotel is Owned by Khanna Enterprises (Kenilworth) Ltd (05948357) under licence from IHG Hotels Ltd

Registered Office: Greenhill House, 90/93 Cowcross Street, London, EC1M 6BF

Company Registration Number: 05948357 VAT No: 918 0213 50




Holiday Inn Kenilworth - Warwick

212 Abbey End
Kenilworth

CV8 1ED
Great Britain

Tel:+44 (0) 1926 855 957 Hollday Inn'

Fax:+44 (0) 1926 855 952 AN IHG'HOTEL
E-mail: mail@hi-kenilworth.com
Web: http://www.bgam.co.uk

Invoice
Ryan Swaine Room No. . 416
20 Laycock Fields Arrival . 28/02/25
Cowling
Keighley Cowling North Yorkshire Departure . 02/03/25
Great Britain Reference
Folio Number
Cashier . [ AFO1
VAT # - 918 0213 50
Page . 10f2
Company: Date . 02/03/25
Group:

Information Copy
IHG Rewards: PC 390190553

Date Description Charges Payments
£ £
28/02/25 Deposit Transfer at Check-In 270.41
28/02/25 Cafe & Bistro Beverage Room# 416 : CHECK# 8329 9.90
28/02/25 *Accommodation (Inclusive VAT) 109.06
01/03/25 *Accommodation (Inclusive VAT) 161.35
02/03/25 MasterCard XXXXXXXXXXXXE6124 9.90
Total Balance Due £ 0.00
VAT Breakdown
Net £ VATE Gross£
VAT@ 20% 233.59 46.72 280.31
VAT@ 12.5% 0.00 0.00 0.00
VAT@ 5% 0.00 0.00 0.00
VAT@ 4% 0.00 0.00 0.00
VAT@ 2.5% 0.00 0.00 0.00
VAT@ 1% 0.00 0.00 0.00
VAT@ 0% 0.00 0.00 0.00
VAT Exempt 0.00 0.00 0.00
Total 280.31
Signature:

This hotel is Owned by Khanna Enterprises (Kenilworth) Ltd (05848357) under licence from IHG Hotels Ltd
Registered Office: Greenhill House, 90/93 Cowcross Street, London, EC1M 6BF
Company Registration Number: 05948357 VAT No: 918 0213 50
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Holiday Inn Kenilworth - Warwick

212 Abbey End
Kenilworth

CV8 1ED
Great Britain

Tel:+44 (0) 1926 855 957 Hollday Inn

Fax:+44 (0) 1926 855 952 AN IHG" HOTEL
E-mail: mail@hi-kenilworth.com

Web: http://www.bgam.co.uk

Invoice
Ryan Swaine Room No. . 416
20 Lgycock Fields Arrival . 28/02/25
Cowling
Keighley Cowling North Yorkshire Departure . 02/03/25
Great Britain Reference
Folio Number
Cashier . | AFO1
VAT # - 918 0213 50
Page v EL T8
Company: Date . 02/03/25
Group:

Information Copy
IHG Rewards: PC 390190553

Date Description

Credit Card Transaction Details

Credit Card Number: HXAXXKXXXXXXXXE6124
Expiry Date: XX/XX
Transaction ID: 43895859

Signature:

This hotel is Owned by Khanna Enterprises (Kenilworth) Ltd (05948357) under licence from IHG Hotels Lid
Registered Office: Greenhill House, 90/93 Cowcross Street, London, EC1M 68F
Company Registration Number: 05948357 VAT No: 918 0213 50







Almanack

cva 1QJ
MlD **********11981

TID: wrExB09

Mastercard

Ca[-d I]D; ******k*i***61’24
PAN seq. no: 04
AlD: A0000000041010

Sale
Amount: £11.00

Total: £11.00

APPROVED

Date & time:  28/02/2025 2207
Auth code: 095191
Payment method:  Contactless
Verification method: None

Transaction ID: 114dd

Pracessed by DOJO

Privacy policy: dojo.tech/leyal/privacy/
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