
Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com>

Re: New Order IMP 226_25
1 message

Thiago Moreira Facciolli <thiago@underpressure.com.br>
To: ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Cc: michael.lamb@vmsecure.me.uk

Ryan,

Please update our address like below:

Em 27 de mar. de 2025, à(s) 10:23, Ryan Swaine <ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk> escreveu:

Dear Thiago

Thank you for your request, I hope you are keeping well.

Please find your proforma invoice attached. I have used the same courier details as on your previous order, please can you confirm if these are correct?

Please let me know if you would like to make a card payment and I will forward you a link.

Best regards
Ryan

Ryan Swaine
General Manager
VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk
Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900
Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: Thiago Moreira Facciolli <thiago@underpressure.com.br>
Date: Thu, 27 Mar 2025 at 12:56
Subject: New Order IMP 226_25
To: <office@viamed.co.uk>

Dear Michael,

Please send me Proforma Invoice to 10 x R-17Van

27/03/2025, 14:40 Gmail - Re: New Order IMP 226_25

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/1/?ik=22eb7d1d9a&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f:1827752050398456103%7Cmsg-f:1827754214951598… 1/2
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Thanks in advance,
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