27/03/2025, 08:19 Gmail - RE: Purchase Order 2025-026 from Innerspace Systems Corp of Texas

M Gma" Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>
RE: Purchase Order 2025-026 from Innerspace Systems Corp of Texas

1 message

Sales & Support <sales@megccr.com> 26 March 2025 at 17:07

To: Kate Giriffiths <kate.griffiths@vandagraphst.com>

Hi Kate

Thank you for your quick and thoughtful response.

Please note what was sent is a “Request for Quote”.

| will need to turn this information over to our contacts at the Navy who will look it over and approve or dis-
approve.

Once and IF they choose to proceed, | will send you a Formal Purchase order.

Should we assume there will be the same 3 month wait to fulfill the order once it is formally placed?

Be Safe & Enjoy The Dive

Waynne Fowler

InnerSpace System Corp. of Texas.
1336 FM 450 South
Hallsville TX, 75650

PH: 360-330-9018
OPEN: Mon-Thur 8am-4:30pm CT

CLOSED: Fri-Sun

From: Kate Griffiths <kate.griffiths@vandagraphst.com>

Sent: Wednesday, March 26, 2025 12:00 PM

To: Sales & Support <sales@megccr.com>

Subject: Re: Purchase Order 2025-026 from Innerspace Systems Corp of Texas

Good afternoon,

Thank you for your PO 2025-026.

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=b5871a5be0&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f:1827672026210131834%7Cmsg-f:1827677273503198... 1/2


https://www.google.com/maps/search/1336+FM+450+South+%0D%0A+Hallsville+TX,+75650?entry=gmail&source=g
https://www.google.com/maps/search/1336+FM+450+South+%0D%0A+Hallsville+TX,+75650?entry=gmail&source=g
mailto:kate.griffiths@vandagraphst.com
mailto:kate.griffiths@vandagraphst.com
mailto:sales@megccr.com

27/03/2025, 08:19 Gmail - RE: Purchase Order 2025-026 from Innerspace Systems Corp of Texas
Please could | advise you of unit price GBP £32.60 which equates to approx. USD $41.00 each.

Please see attached order confirmation.

Steve Nixon has advised me that the provisional shipping date is July 7th 2025.

Kind regards

Kate Griffiths
Vandagraph Sensor Technologies

kate.griffiths@vandagraphst.com

VST is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone calls
to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use email where possible

E-mail Disclaimer

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in
reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with
delete in the subject line.

On Wed, 26 Mar 2025 at 15:58, Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> wrote:

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Sales & Support <sales@megccr.com>

Date: Wed, 26 Mar 2025 at 14:56

Subject: Purchase Order 2025-026 from Innerspace Systems Corp of Texas
To: steve.nixon@vandagraphst.com <steve.nixon@vandagraphst.com>

Dear Vendor:
Please review the attached Purchase Order. Feel free to contact us if you have any questions.
Thank you for your service.

Sincerely,
Innerspace Systems Corp of Texas

3603309018
WWW.megccr.com
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