
Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

Fwd: Purchase Order 2025-026 from Innerspace Systems Corp of Texas
1 message

Steve Nixon <steve.nixon@vandagraphst.com> 26 March 2025 at 15:43
To: office@vmsecure.me.uk

Please process the attached as a VST purchase order from InnerSpace Systems:

60 x 8010012   £32.60 each
Set provisional shipment date to 07/05. Set as OK to ship early.

Advise them of unit price GBP £32.60 (equates to approx. USD $41.00) each.

Steve

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: Sales & Support <sales@megccr.com>
Date: Wed, 26 Mar 2025 at 14:56
Subject: Purchase Order 2025-026 from Innerspace Systems Corp of Texas
To: steve.nixon@vandagraphst.com <steve.nixon@vandagraphst.com>

Dear Vendor:

Please review the attached Purchase Order. Feel free to contact us if you have any questions.

Thank you for your service.

Sincerely,
Innerspace Systems Corp of Texas

3603309018
www.megccr.com

--
 
 
Steve
 
 
Steve Nixon
Director - Vandagraph Sensor Technologies Ltd.

Office:  +44 (0)1535 634900
Mobile: +44 (0)7850 252267
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