14/03/2025, 13:29 Gmail - Re: proof of payment

M Gma" Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

Re: proof of payment
1 message

Jorge Morano <jorge.morano@gmail.com> 14 March 2025 at 13:09
To: Kate Giriffiths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>

Good morning Kate, | hope everything is okay.

| have not been able to solve the transport contract.

for this time you could make the shipment as they did before?. | will pay those
expenses.

Thank you, and we apologize for the inconvenience caused.

El vie, 14 mar 2025 a las 5:17, Kate Giriffiths (<kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>) escribio:
Good morning Jorge,

Our warehouse team have asked me to let you know that your parcel is is awaiting collection.
Many thanks.
Kind regards
Kate Griffiths

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone
calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use email where possible.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken
in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with
delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Mon, 10 Mar 2025 at 13:15, Kate Giriffiths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Thank you Jorge,

The details are correct.

Kind regards

Kate Griffiths
http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542
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Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office.
Telephone calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use email where possible.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be
taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with
delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Mon, 10 Mar 2025 at 13:12, Jorge Morano <jorge.morano@gmail.com> wrote:
OK, | understand then that | must request UPS to pick up the package.
The withdrawal data are:

Viamed Ltd

15 Station Road, Cross Hills
Keighley, West Yorkshire BD20 7DT
United Kingdom (UK)

Qe Phone: +44 (0) 1535 634542
Contact email: kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
£ Contact: Kate Griffiths

Please confirm that everything is correct so that you do not make mistakes with
UPS Transportation.
Thank you

El'lun, 10 mar 2025 a las 9:11, Kate Griffiths (<kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>) escribié:
Hi Jorge,

Thank you for your email. As | replied in my last email, your order is EXW, for you to arrange collection.
Kind regards

Kate Griffiths

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office.
Telephone calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use email where possible.

E-mail Disclaimer
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14/03/2025, 13:29 Gmail - Re: proof of payment

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be
taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply
with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Mon, 10 Mar 2025 at 12:08, Jorge Morano <jorge.morano@gmail.com> wrote:
Good morning Kate, | hope everything is okay.

| understand that my order is ready to be shipped. Do you have any idea
when the shipment will be made? are they still using UPS? | wait for tracking
number. Best regards.

El vie, 7 mar 2025 a las 5:29, Kate Griffiths (<kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>) escribio:
Good morning Jorge,

Your order is EXW, for you to arrange collection:

Order Confirmation CVM152213 Page 1

EXW Ex Works Viamed, UK * Incoterms(R) 2020
Your Viamed Contact for this Order Confirmation : kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
ltem Reference Description Quantity  Unit Unit Vat Total

0110081 Teledyne Oxygen Sensor UFO 130-2 3 214.00 642.00
Tariff 9019209000
CaO United States

PAYPAL PayPal Account : paypal@viamed.co.uk 1 3852 38.52

EXW Delivery: EXW - Viamed, UK (Incoterms 2020) 1 0.00 0.00

Consigned to:
Total Net: 680.52
Total Vat: 0.00

Paid Total: 680.52
Delivery Address

Lucas MB Vazquez / Jorge Morano
University Park Condominium
International Route San Jose Corner
Wen. Lopez C/Destacamento Cazal
San Lorenzo

111421

Paraguay

Kind regards

Kate Griffiths
http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office.
Telephone calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use email where possible.

E-mail Disclaimer
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GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted
to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please
reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Thu, 6 Mar 2025 at 21:55, Jorge Morano <jorge.morano@gmail.com> wrote:
Good afternoon Kate, thanks for the heads up. Is DVM152213-1 shipped by UPS?
Regards

El jue, 6 mar 2025 a las 8:46, Kate Griffiths (<kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>) escribio:
Good morning Jorge,

Please see attached invoice with weights and dimensions.
Your parcel is ready for collection.

Kind regards

Kate Griffiths

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the
office. Telephone calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use email where
possible.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or
omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list,
please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Tue, 21 Jan 2025 at 10:55, Kate Giriffiths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Good morning Jorge,

Please accept my apologies for not letting you know sooner. There is a led time of approximately
4-5 weeks for your order.

The stock that | had hoped would be available for your order before you paid has now been sold.
Kind regards

Kate Griffiths

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542
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Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the
office. Telephone calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use email
where possible.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or
omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list,
please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Mon, 20 Jan 2025 at 15:52, Kate Giriffiths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Good afternoon Jorge,

Thank you for your other payment.

Please see attached order confirmation.

| will let you know when the order has been picked.
Kind regards

Kate Griffiths

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in
the office. Telephone calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use email
where possible.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or
omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing
list, please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Wed, 8 Jan 2025 at 12:57, Kate Giriffiths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Thank you Jorge.

Kind regards
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Kate Griffiths

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and
in the office. Telephone calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use
email where possible.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.
If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken
or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing
list, please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Wed, 8 Jan 2025 at 12:40, Jorge Morano <jorge.morano@gmail.com> wrote:
Sorry, you're right. I'll see how to fix it and I'll let you know. Thanks.

El mié, 8 de ene de 2025, 09:05, Kate Griffiths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk> escribio:
Hi Jorge,

Thank you for your reply. The amount you show is $580 but the proformas is for
$680.52

Ha enviado
580,00 $ USD

a Viamed Ltd.

Proforma Invoice MVM152213 Page 1

EXW Ex Works Viamed, UK * Incoterms(R) 2020
ontact for this Proforma Invoice : kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk

Jescription Quantity Unit Unit Vat Total
‘eledyne Oxygen Sensor UFO 130-2 3 214.00 642.00
'ayPal Account : paypal@viamed.co.uk 1 38.52 38.52
Jelivery: EXW - Viamed, UK (Incoterms 2020) 1 0.00 0.00
onsigned to:
Total Net: 680.52
Total Vat: 0.00
Total: 680.52

Kind regards

Kate Griffiths
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http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely
and in the office. Telephone calls to the main office will be answered, but please
continue to use email where possible.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is
unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action
taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our
mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Wed, 8 Jan 2025 at 11:43, Jorge Morano <jorge.morano@gmail.com> wrote:
Good morning Kate!!!. The full payment was sent, | sent proof again. If you have any
questions, let me know. Thank you.

El mié, 8 de ene de 2025, 08:34, Kate Griffiths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>
escribio:

Good morning Jorge,

| hope you are well.

Please see my previous emails. We are unable to ship your order due to
insufficient payment received.

If this is no longer required, please let me know and we can reimburse you.
Many thanks.

Kind regards

Kate Griffiths

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work
remotely and in the office. Telephone calls to the main office will be answered, but
please continue to use email where possible.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy
The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.
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Gmail - Re: proof of payment

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is
unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any
action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be
unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from
our mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535
634542

On Tue, 17 Dec 2024 at 08:52, Kate Griffiths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

Good morning Jorge,
Thank you for your email.

| emailed the following on 26th November:

Re: budget ©

m Kate Griffiths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uks Tue 26 Nov, 0857 ¥ @

to Jorge =

Good moming Jorge

Thank you for the payment in USD of $580 (excluding PayPal fee). The proforma invoice was for $680.52.

Amount received $580.00 USD

Fee $24.60 USD

Total $555.40 USD

Are you able to pay the difference please?
Kind regards
Kate Griffiths

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work
remotely and in the office. Telephone calls to the main office will be answered, but
please continue to use email where possible.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is
unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any
action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be
unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from
our mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535
634542

On Mon, 16 Dec 2024 at 20:55, Jorge Morano <jorge.morano@gmail.com>
wrote:
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Jorge B Morano
Cel 266-154400952

Jorge B Morano
Cel 266-154400952

Jorge B Morano
Cel 266-154400952

Jorge B Morano
Cel 266-154400952
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Gmail - Re: proof of payment

Hi Kate, sorry | forgot to send you the proof of payment. Do you have any idea
when the oxygen sensors will be shipped? Thanks.
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