3/10/25, 9:53 AM Gmail - Fwd: Oder enquiry

M Gma" Agib Majeed <viamed.aqib.majeed2@gmail.com>

Fwd: Oder enquiry

Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> Mon, Mar 10, 2025 at 8:33 AM
To: Agib Majeed <aqib.majeed@vmsecure.me.uk>

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Jude Louis <secondbaseng@gmail.com>
Date: Sat, 8 Mar 2025 at 21:26

Subject: Re: Oder enquiry

To: Sophie Lines <sophie.lines@viamed.co.uk>

Greetings Sophie.

I'm interested in purchasing 5 pcs of oxygen sensors for Vg70 ventilator -
Part number 0110021 (R-22MEDV).

Can | please get the price quote and access to make the payment?

Thanks
Second Base Investment Nigeria limited.

Chimezie Louis Jude
07448936004.

On Wed, 29 May 2024, 10:44 Sophie Lines, <sophie.lines@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Good morning,

Thank you for your email. | spoke to you on the phone earlier, and you mentioned you first contacted Janine - unfortunately, Janine no longer works for Viamed
Ltd. Orders@viamed.co.uk is now the correct email to contact.

| can confirm our compatible sensor for the S+VOX Oxygen Sensor is our part number 0110021 (R-22MEDV):

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=18de0f2fa7&view=pt&search=all&permmsgid=msg-f:1826195430070507017 &simpl=msg-f: 1826 195430070507017
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