
Ryan Swaine <viamed.ryan.swaine@gmail.com>

Re: New customer message on 5 March 2025 at 21:10
1 message

Twan Donkers <twan@kymo.net> 7 March 2025 at 12:15
To: ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk

Hi

Good to hear that it is not a problem.
Just make a new invoice and send me a link to pay

What do I want

1x Oxygen sensor R-33DE (53.-)
1x Oxygen sensor R-17VAN (38.-)
2x 7910201 (2x 125.-)
1x 9730215 (22.-)

Twan Donkers
Diving center KYMO

Op do 6 mrt 2025 om 11:17 schreef Ryan Swaine <ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk>:
Dear Twan

Thank you very much for your enquiry.

We would be very happy to extend to you our dealer pricing and I am pleased to inform you that we do not impose
any minimum order quantities.

Please find attached some product information, our dealer pricing and a quotation for 1x R-17VAN and 1x R-33DE
sensor.

Please let me know if you have any questions. If you would like to proceed with the order, then you can make your
payment to the bank details listed at the bottom of the invoice or I can send you a link if you would prefer to make a
card payment.

I look forward to your response.

Kind regards
Ryan

Ryan Swaine
General Manager
VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk
Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900
Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

On Wed, 5 Mar 2025 at 21:10, Vandagraph (Shopify) <mailer@shopify.com> wrote:

You received a new message from your online store's contact form.

Country Code:
NL
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Name:
Twan Donkers

Email:
twan@kymo.net

Phone Number:
0618555367

Message:
Hi,

I have had a diving center in Breda since 2008. I have recently been
receiving questions about whether I can supply O2 sensors,
specifically the R-17VAN Oxygen Sensor (0110217) and the R-33DE
Oxygen Sensor (0110224)
Can you send this to us at the dealer's price? to start with 1 piece of
each
my details: Duikcentrum KYMO, Veldsteen 14, 4815PK Breda,
Nederland. kvk 74987941 vatnumber: nl001670562b15

kind regards

Twan Donkers
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