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On Sun, 2 Mar 2025 at 13:33, Phwong Thai Thi Trinh <trinhphuong@anantrading.vn> wrote:
Dear Aqib,

| want to add 5pcs of R-30V Oxygen Sensor in my order. Is it ready in your stock? Can we combine them to delivery under 1 Airway Bill?

Thank you and Best Regards,

An An Import Export Co.,Ltd

109/11/19 4th Street, 16th Ward, Go Vap District, HCMC, VN
Tel: 84 987 546 072

Vao Th 6, 21 thg 2, 2025 luc 19:39 Aqib Majeed <viamed.aqib.majeed@gmail.com> d viét:
Hello

Good morning
Thank you for the payment.

We do have a lead time of 2-4 weeks before we can dispatch your order as we are waiting for further stock to arrive, of course if they arrive sooner
than expected we will make you aware before we dispatch your order.

Please let me know if | can assist with anything else.
Kind regards

Aqgib Majeed
Office Administrator
Viamed Ltd.
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