3/4/25, 2:35 PM Gmail - Fwd: order

M Gmail

Fwd: order

Ryan Swaine <ryan.swaine@yviamed.co.uk>
Reply-To: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk

Aqib Majeed <viamed.aqib.majeed@gmail.com>

4 March 2025 at 14:06

To: Kate Giriffitths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>, Aqib Majeed <aqgib.majeed@yviamed.co.uk>, Sophie Lines <sophie.lines@viamed.co.uk>

Hi, please can we process the proforma invoice for 4x 0110510 Oxygen Sensor INQOX MediceL

Thank you
Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Claudia Damian <achiziti@medicalcorp.ro>
Date: Tue, 4 Mar 2025 at 12:13

Subject: order

To: <ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk>

Hi Ryan,

Glad to hear good news from you. | am fine , thank you! &

Is the sensor original or non-original? Anyway, please deliver 4 pcs of this oxygen sensor.

| am waiting the PI with the shipping cost for these. &

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=07ddd72f30&view=pt&search=all&permmsgid=msg-f:1825672724772177695&simpl=msg-f: 1825672724772177695&mb=1
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Thank you in advance!

Wish you a lovely day!

Claudia Damian

Acquisition manager

Medical Corp SRL

Phone: +0269.232.673, int 22
+0269.245.532, int 22
+0369.447.835, int 22

Mobile: +40 728 030 738

Email: achiziti@medicalcorp.ro

Gheorghe Lazar Str, No.8

Romania, 550165 Sibiu

www.medicalcorp.ro
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You can reach us during our office hours: Monday - Thursday: 7:30 am-4:30pm & Friday: 7:30am-2pm (EET)

Importer of medical equipment: patient monitors, electrocardiographs, holter EKG, ultrasound systems, spirometers, audiometers, aerosol machines, ophthalmoscopes, defibrillators, autoclaves,

electrocautery, oxygen concentrators, emergency equipment, paper for EKG and for the printer from the ultrasound machine, cables, consumables, etc.
Service for any type of medical equipment.

(EN) This email has been sent from Medical Corp SRL. The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged. It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized. If you
are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution nor any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful. If you have received this message in error, please notify the

sender immediately, and delete this email from your system.

Before printing this document, think about the environment!

De la: Ryan Swaine <ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk>
Trimis: 4 martie 2025 13:12

Catre: Claudia Damian <achiziti@medicalcorp.ro>
Subiect: Re: offer request

Hi Claudia

I’'m very well, thank you. | hope you are too.

I’'m pleased to inform you that we can supply the sensor shown in your pictures:
0110510 Oxygen Sensor INQOX MedicelL

e 1unit =€85.10

¢ 10 units = €65.30 each
¢ 50 units =€51.50 each
¢ 100 units = €46.80 each

These are available from stock.
Please let me know if you have any questions.

Best regards
Ryan
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Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542

Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Tue, 4 Mar 2025 at 10:30, Claudia Damian <achiziti@medicalcorp.ro> wrote:

Dear Ryan,

How are you doing? Hope you are fine.

Please let me know if you have the attached oxygen filter... and the offer, as well. &

Thank you in advance!

Wish you to have a lovely day!

Claudia Damian

Acquisition manager

Medical Corp SRL
Phone: +0269.232.673, int 22
+0269.245.532, int 22

+0369.447.835, int 22
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Mobile: +40 728 030 738

Email: achiziti@medicalcorp.ro
Gheorghe Lazar Str, No.8
Romania, 550165 Sibiu

www.medicalcorp.ro
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You can reach us during our office hours: Monday - Thursday: 7:30 am-4:30pm & Friday: 7:30am-2pm (EET)

Importer of medical equipment: patient monitors, electrocardiographs, holter EKG, ultrasound systems, spirometers, audiometers, aerosol machines, ophthalmoscopes, defibrillators, autoclaves,

electrocautery, oxygen concentrators, emergency equipment, paper for EKG and for the printer from the ultrasound machine, cables, consumables, etc.

Service for any type of medical equipment.

(EN) This email has been sent from Medical Corp SRL. The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged. It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized. If

you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution nor any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful. If you have received this message in error, please notify

the sender immediately, and delete this email from your system.

Before printing this document, think about the environment!
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