04/03/2025, 09:26

M Gmail

Gmail - Fwd: Due Date: 01/03/2025 - Request for Quotation 4779/2025 O2 Cell

Sophie Lines <viamed.sophie.lines@gmail.com>

Fwd: Due Date: 01/03/2025 - Request for Quotation 4779/2025 O2 Cell

1 message

Ryan Swaine <ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk> Mon, Mar 3, 2025 at 3:18 PM
Reply-To: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
To: Kate Griffitths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>, Agib Majeed <agib.majeed@viamed.co.uk>, Sophie Lines

<sophie.lines@viamed.co.uk>

Hi,please can we send Sibiliy a proforma invoice (USD Distributor) for 150x R-49V sensors.
The W&D from Cathy are as follows: 12kg 61x47x47cm

Thank you, Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk

Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: <sibily@aafiamed.com>
Date: Sun, 2 Mar 2025 at 10:19

Subject: RE: Due Date: 01/03/2025 - Request for Quotation 4779/2025 O2 Cell

To: <ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk>
Cc: <marketing@aafiamed.com>,

Dear Ryan,

admin <admin@aafiamed.com>

Thanks for the product datasheet.

Is it possible to get any letter confirming that the offered model is manufactured for Hamilton G5 Ventilator and
compatible with original part# 3960087

Also, good if you can provide us an estimated shipping cost to Qatar.

Aafia Medical

Sibily Sulaiman

Sales Manager

M: (974) 5516 7733
T: (974) 4416 7575
F: (974) 4465 9784

E: sibily@aafiamed.com

Aafia Medical Equipment Trading W.L.L
Al Khalidya Street
P.O.Box.: 201544 | Doha - Qatar
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www.aafiamed.com

From: Ryan Swaine <ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk>

Sent: 27 February 2025 16:10

To: sibily@aafiamed.com

Subject: Re: Due Date: 01/03/2025 - Request for Quotation 4779/2025 02 Cell

Dear Sibily
Please find the datasheet attached.
Please let me know if there is anything else you need.

Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542

Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Thu, 27 Feb 2025 at 13:05, <sibily@aafiamed.com> wrote:

Dear Ryan,

Thank you very much providing the quote.

Could you please share us the product brochure as well?

’ Sibily Sulaiman

IF""“‘ Sales Manager

Aafia Medical
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M: (974) 5516 7733
T: (974) 4416 7575
F: (974) 4465 9784

E: sibily@aafiamed.com

Aafia Medical Equipment Trading W.L.L
Al Khalidya Street
P.O.Box.: 201544 | Doha - Qatar

www.aafiamed.com

From: Ryan Swaine <ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk>

Sent: 27 February 2025 12:59

To: sibily@aafiamed.com

Cc: admin@aafiamed.com; marketing@aafiamed.com

Subject: Re: Due Date: 01/03/2025 - Request for Quotation 4779/2025 02 Cell

Dear Sibily

Thank you very much for your email.

The sensor you require is as follows:
0110049 Oxygen sensor R-49V = USD $37.75 each EXW
Manufactured by Honeywell for Viamed

Country of Origin: Germany

We have stock available, but for a single delivery of 150 pieces we would have them made to order which would have a
lead time of approximately 6 weeks from receipt of payment against proforma invoice.

Please let me know if you have any questions.

Kind regards
Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542

Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy
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On Thu, 27 Feb 2025 at 07:17, <sibily@aafiamed.com> wrote:

Dear Ryan,

Hope you are doing fine.

We have an enquiry from a government hospital for the below item.

1. 02 CELL, PART# 396008 x 150 Each
Equip: Ventilator Hamilton G5 (SW VERSION 2.42)
Part should be original and brand-new item
Item should be from fresh stock and should not be older than 6 months on delivery.

Manufacturer and country of origin should be mentioned in the quote.

Hope you will be able to provide us a quote for the above item.

Looking forward to your earliest response.

’ Sibily Sulaiman
I_"‘ Sales Manager
Aafia Medical M: (974) 5516 7733

T: (974) 4416 7575
F: (974) 4465 9784

E: sibily@aafiamed.com

Aafia Medical Equipment Trading W.L.L
Al Khalidya Street
P.0.Box.: 201544 | Doha - Qatar

www.aafiamed.com

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Ryan Swaine

Sent: 21 February 2023 18:42

To: sibily@aafiamed.com

Subject: Re: SMART CAPNOLINE PEDIATRIC ORAL-NASAL MICROSTREAM FILTER LINE 02 2 M 25 UN @ 12,000 Qty .

Dear Sibily

Please find an overview attached. Please just let me know if you have any questions.

Kind regards
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Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542

Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Tue, 21 Feb 2023 at 15:23, <sibily@aafiamed.com> wrote:
Dear Mr Ryan Swaine

We really appreciate your effort in sending the quotation to us. The date for sample submission is very near so that
we cannot do this time. It took lot of time to reach you this time.

We will contact you for future enquiries.
Please send your list of Products you deal with, so next time we can reach earlier.

Expect to hear from you soon.

Thanks and Best Regards,

’ Sibily Sulaiman
‘ ‘ Sales Manager
(974) 5516 7733

M:
. . T: (974) 4416 7575
Aafia Medical F: (974) 4465 9784
E: sibily@aafiamed.com
Aafia Medical Equipment Trading W.L.L

Al Khalidya Street
P.0.Box.: 201544 | Doha - Qatar

www.aafiamed.com

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Ryan Swaine
Sent: 20 February 2023 15:04
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To: sibily@aafiamed.com
Subject: Re: SMART CAPNOLINE PEDIATRIC ORAL-NASAL MICROSTREAM FILTER LINE 022 M 25 UN @
12,000 Qty .

Dear Sibily Sulaiman

Thank you very much for your email. We would be very happy to quote you for our Versastram Nasal Cannula,
which meets the requirements of your tender.

Paediatric Nasal/Oral Sampling line with O2 delivery, Oridion Microstream compatible - part no. 4420916

Manufacturers Name: Bluepoint Medical

Country of Origin: Germany

Authorization letter: We can supply this as soon as you reply that you are happy to proceed

Freight charges: Dependent on the qty to be shipped each time, we can supply a quote using UPS.

We Have to submit samples of 10 no for evaluation with following details

Paediatric Nasal/Oral Sampling line with O2 delivery, Oridion Microstream compatible - part no. 4420916 = USD
$69.00 / box of 10 pieces EXW

| can confirm that the Versastream lines and cannula are fully CE certified.

I look forward to your reply and any questions you may have.

Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542

Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Sun, 19 Feb 2023 at 14:17, Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=d 104de5290&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f:1825586669361100472%7Cmsg-f: 182558666936 1100... 6/8


https://mail.google.com/mail/?view=cm&fs=1&tf=1&to=sibily@aafiamed.com
http://www.viamed.co.uk/
https://mail.google.com/mail/?view=cm&fs=1&tf=1&to=ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
http://www.viamed.co.uk/policy
https://mail.google.com/mail/?view=cm&fs=1&tf=1&to=office@viamed.co.uk

04/03/2025, 09:26 Gmail - Fwd: Due Date: 01/03/2025 - Request for Quotation 4779/2025 O2 Cell

—————————— Forwarded message ---------

From: <sibily@aafiamed.com>

Date: Sat, 18 Feb 2023 at 15:46

Subject: SMART CAPNOLINE PEDIATRIC ORAL-NASAL MICROSTREAM FILTER LINE 022 M 25 UN @
12,000 Qty .

To: <sales@viamed.co.uk>

Dear Sir,

Good Day !!!!

We Aafia Medical Equipment Trading is an Official registered Supplier for Major hospitals and Public Health
centres for Medical Equipment, Medical Consumables, Medical Furniture, Medical spare parts etc in Qatar.

Currently we have a requirement for SMART CAPNOLINE PEDIATRIC ORAL-NASAL MICROSTREAM FILTER
LINE 022 M 25 UN @ 12,000 Qty for a tender which is closing on 26th February 2023.

Please find attached the Tender specs along with this with following details.

Manufacturers Name
Country of Origin
Authorization letter
Freight charges

We Have to submit samples of 10 no for evaluation with following details,

Manufacturers Name

Batch number

Expiry date

Shelf life (minimum 2/3 rd required)
Country of Origin

CE/FDA CERIFIED

Expecting to hear from you soon.

Thanks and Best Regards,

’ Sibily Sulaiman
f‘ ‘ Sales Manager

Aafia Medical

M: (974) 5516 7733
T: (974) 4416 7575
F: (974) 4465 9784

E: sibily@aafiamed.com
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Aafia Medical Equipment Trading W.L.L
Al Khalidya Street
P.O.Box.: 201544 | Doha - Qatar

www.aafiamed.com

ﬂ 0110049 Specification Datasheet ID17622 (1).pdf
200K
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