
Ryan Swaine <viamed.ryan.swaine@gmail.com>

Re: GOEL370
1 message

James Lim <james@trim-systems.com.sg>
To: ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Cc: sharon@trim-systems.com.sg, elva@trim-systems.com.sg, moeyi <moeyi@trim-systems.com.sg>

Dear Ryan,

We confirm 10 pieces of R-17VAN at GBP38 each. Could you scan proforma invoice over?

Sent from my iPhone

On 3 Mar 2025, at 19:13, Ryan Swaine <ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk> wrote:

Hi James

Thank you for your email.

The trade price for the R-17VAN is still GBP £38 each EXW.
We have them available from stock for immediate dispatch.

Please let me know if you would like us to send you a proforma invoice.

Best regards
Ryan

Ryan Swaine
General Manager
VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk
Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900
Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

On Mon, 3 Mar 2025 at 08:59, <james@trim-systems.com.sg> wrote:

Dear Ryan,

 

Please advise price and delivery for 10 pieces of R-17VAN.

 

Best Regards

James Lim

Trim Systems Pte Ltd

11 Tuas South Link 1, #03-12/13/14,

Shine@Tuas South,

Singapore 636901

 

Tel: +65-62664566
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