M Gma" Emily Hanson <viamed.emily.hanson@gmail.com>

Fwd: Invoice - RVM155201-1 Order 1473505

3 messages

Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> Mon, Mar 3, 2025 at 9:36 AM
To: emily.hanson@vmsecure.me.uk

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: SQUIRRELL, Samantha (TORBAY AND SOUTH DEVON NHS FOUNDATION TRUST)
<samantha.squirrell@nhs.net>

Date: Mon, 3 Mar 2025 at 09:30

Subject: Invoice - RVM155201-1 Order 1473505

To: info@viamed.co.uk <info@viamed.co.uk>

Cc: PAYMENTS (TORBAY AND SOUTH DEVON NHS FOUNDATION TRUST) <tsdft.payments@nhs.net>

Good Morning

Order 1473505 is for Qty 3 and the price is £12.10 as per your price break below.

Date 03032025

SupplD | Unit | Cur E:LE To value P:[:i Supp.prod Supp.prod.descr
T 0.00 0.00/ 0.00/
1 UN GBP 0.00 1000 16200021013 POSEY PULSE OXIMETRY SENSOR WRAP MODEL 6554 BOX OF 12
2 UN | GBP 2.00 200 13150021013 POSEY PULSE OXIMETRY SENSOR WRAP MODEL 6554 BOX OF 12
3 UN GBP 3.00 1000 12100021013  POSEY PULSE OXIMETRY SENSOR WRAP MODEL 6554 BOX OF 12
4 UN  GBP 11.00)99,999.99 11.750021013  POSEY PULSE OXIMETRY SENSOR WRAP MODEL 6554 BOX OF 12

Invoice attached is for Qty 2 @ £13.15 when our order is for Qty 3.

Please can you send through a copy of the credit note, attached invoice is on hold.

Any problems please contact me.

Many regards

Sam Squirrell

Clinical Buyer



mailto:samantha.squirrell@nhs.net
mailto:info@viamed.co.uk
mailto:info@viamed.co.uk
mailto:tsdft.payments@nhs.net

Please note, due to heavy demands on the Procurement Department and reduced staffing levels, we may take longer
than normal to reply to emails and requests. We will reply to all emails in due course — Thank you for your patience.

Torbay and South Devon NHS Foundation Trust
Procurement & Logistics | Regent House | Regent Close | Torquay TQ2 7AN
Direct Line: 01803 653358 | Internal: 53358 | Email:Samantha.squirrell@nhs.net

Website: www.torbayandsouthdevon.nhs.uk

Working with you, for you
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This message may contain confidential information. If you are not the intended
recipient please:

i) inform the sender that you have received the message in error before deleting it;
and

ii) do not disclose, copy or distribute information in this e-mail or take any action
in relation to its content (to do so is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful).
Thank you for your co-operation.

NHSmail is the secure email, collaboration and directory service available for all NHS
staff in England. NHSmail is approved for exchanging patient data and other sensitive
information with NHSmail and other accredited email services.

For more information and to find out how you can switch visit Joining NHSmail — NHSmail
Support

2 attachments

ﬂ 0001_RVM155201-1.pdf
93K

&) 1473505.pdf
183K

Emily Morton <emily.morton@viamed.co.uk> Mon, Mar 3, 2025 at 9:42 AM
To: helen lamb <helen.lamb@yviamed.co.uk>
Bcc: viamedinbox@gmail.com

Helen,

im not sure what to do with this one? do i put a foc box of posey on order?
Kind regards

Emily Morton

Office Administrator

Viamed Ltd.

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email: emily.morton@viamed.co.uk

Tel: 44 (0)1535 634 542
Fax: 44 (0)1535 635 582
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Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in
reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with
delete in the subject line or call 44 (0)1535 634542

[Quoted text hidden]

2 attachments

ﬂ 0001_RVM155201-1.pdf
93K

ﬂ 1473505.pdf
183K

helen lamb <helen.lamb@viamed.co.uk> Mon, Mar 3, 2025 at 10:11 AM
To: Emily Morton <emily.morton@yviamed.co.uk>

If I understand correctly they got two posey at the 2 price but ordered 3.

put an order on for one at the 3 off price with the same order number and i will credit the price difference on the
original invoice they have.

Kind regards

Helen Lamb
Accounts Director
Viamed Ltd

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email: helen.lamb@yviamed.co.uk
Email: helen.lamb@yviamed.me.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634 542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635 582

Sign up to our mailing list, go to www.viamed.co.uk/sign-up

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook: facebook.com/ViamedLtdUK

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in
reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with
delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

[Quoted text hidden]
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