2/24/25, 11:31 AM Gmail - RE: PURCHASE ORDER ST/250014

M Gmall Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

RE: PURCHASE ORDER ST/250014

1 message

SAT <sat@prhoinsa.com> 24 February 2025 at 11:12
To: Kate Griffiths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>, orders@yviamed.co.uk
Cc: amelia <a.aragon@prhoinsa.com>, Maria Iglesias <maria.iglesias@prhoinsa.com>

Hi Kate,

| had to change my order. Please send me the modified proforma to proceed with the payment.

| would like to take this opportunity to tell you that we accept partial service, so let me know when
you have the R30V cells ready.

Saludos / Best Regards,
Ana Negoita

Dpto. Administracidon
PRHOINSA

Tel: 91426 17 12

www.prhoinsa.es
sat@prhoinsa.com

Calle de los Almendros 7,
28860 Paracuellos del Jarama
Madrid

Edificio W.A.A.S
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2/24/25, 11:31 AM Gmail - RE: PURCHASE ORDER ST/250014

Aviso Legal, Este mensaje electronico estid dirigido dnicamente al destinatario designado. Su cardcter es personal, confidencial e
intransferible estd protegido legalmente. Cuslquier revelacidn, wso o reenvio no autarizado, total o parcial estd prohibido, S ha
recibide este mensaje por erfor, regamos bo notifiquee de inmediato a la persona que lo remite ¥ borre ¢l mensaje orginal junto

con sus archives adjuntos sin leerlo nl grabarie, total o parciabmente. En cumplimiento del Reglamento Curapeo de Proteccidn de
Datos (EV) 67972016, le comunicarnos que su direccidn de comrea elecirdnico forma parle de un ficherd con la finalidad de

manteneés relaciones profesionales ylo comercialed. 5i lo desea puede ejercer sus derechas de acceto, rectificacion o supretion
["el derecha al alddo), imitacidn al tratamiento y portabilidad, dirigiéndose par eserito al Responsable de los datos: PROYECTOS
HOSPITALARIOS INTERNACIOMNAL, 5.4 CON CILF A-BIR10905 v con domicllio en Camino Viejo de Cohpfia, n® 14, CP. 2R860
PAracusllgs de Jarama (Madrid] y eon teléfone 91.426.17.12 v emall administraclon @ prheinis com iguabmente, 3 no desea recibie
mis proputitas comarciates de nuestra empresa responda @ este mismo correo con el asunio Borrar

De: Kate Griffiths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>

Enviado el: 21 de febrero de 2025 10:53

Para: SAT <sat@prhoinsa.com>; amelia <a.aragon@prhoinsa.com>; Maria Iglesias
<maria.iglesias@prhoinsa.com>

Asunto: Re: PURCHASE ORDER ST/250014

Good morning,

Thank you for your email.

Janine no longer works at Viamed. Please could you email any future orders/enquiries etc
to orders@viamed.co.uk This is an email address that all the office will access.

Please see attached proforma invoice, valid for 30 days. | have used the following for the addresses:

Delivery Address Invoice Address

Proyectos Hospitalarios Proyectos Hospitalarios
Internacional 5.A (Prhoinsa) Internacional 5.A (Prhoinsa)
Calle De Los Almendros 7 Calle De Los Almendros 7
Paracuelios Del Jarama Faracuellos Del Jarama
Madrid Madrid

28860 28860

Spain Spain

Please note that we do not currently have any UFO 130-2 oxygen sensors in stock. | estimate the
lead time as 6-8 weeks.

| have used Fedex for the carriage line. Please let me know if you require any changes to be made.
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2/24/25, 11:31 AM Gmail - RE: PURCHASE ORDER ST/250014

Many thanks.

Kind regards

Kate Griffiths

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office.
Telephone calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use email where possible.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to
be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please
reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542
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2/24/25, 11:31 AM Gmail - RE: PURCHASE ORDER ST/250014

On Thu, 20 Feb 2025 at 16:04, Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: SAT <sat@prhoinsa.com>

Date: Thu, 20 Feb 2025 at 15:11

Subject: PURCHASE ORDER ST/250014

To: <janine.gill@viamed.co.uk>, <office@viamed.co.uk>

Cc: amelia <a.aragon@prhoinsa.com>, Maria Iglesias <maria.iglesias@prhoinsa.com>

Hi Janine,

How are you doing? | hope you are well. It's been a long time since we had contact.

Attached please find a new PO ST/250014.

Please let me know en estimated delivery date.

Saludos / Best Regards,
Ana Negoita

Dpto. Administracion
PRHOINSA

Tel: 91 426 17 12

www.prhoinsa.es
sat@prhoinsa.com

Calle de los Almendros 7,
28860 Paracuellos del Jarama
Madrid

Edificio W.A.A.S
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2/24/25, 11:31 AM Gmail - RE: PURCHASE ORDER ST/250014

Aviso Legal. Este mensaje electronico estd dirighido Gnicamente al destinatario designado, Su cardcter es personal, confidencial &
intransferible estd protegido legalmente. Cualquier revelacidn, uso o reenvio no autorizado, total o parcial estd prohibido, S ha
recibida este mensaje por errar, regamos bo notiique de inmediato a la persona que lo remite y borre el mensaje original junto
oon sus srehives adjuntos sin legrla nl grabarle, total o parcialmente. En cumplimienio del Reglamento Curopes de Proteccidn de
Datos (EU) 67972016, e comunicarnod que su direccidn de correo electronico forma parle de un fichero con la finalidad de
mantener relaclones profesionales yio comerciales. 5ilo desea puede ejercer sut derechas de accesn, rectificacidn o supresidn
("el derecha al alvidol, limitacidn al tratamiento y portabilidsd, dirigléndose par eserito al Responsable de los datos: PROYECTDS
HOSPITALARIOS INTERNACIONAL, 5.A CON CLF A-B2310%05 v con damicilic en Caming Viejo de m:ll 14, C.P. JRRE0D
Parucupdlos de Jarama (Madrid) y con teléfone 91.426.17.12 v emall adminivtra clon @ prheinw . com iguabmente, 3 no desea recibir
mis propuestas comarclaies de nuestra empresa responda 3 este mismo corred con el asunto Borrar,

-E PO ST-250014.pdf
498K
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