2/18/25, 11:47 AM Gmail - Fwd: NEW ORDER FEB-2025

M Gma|l Aqib Majeed <viamed.aqib.majeed@gmail.com>

Fwd: NEW ORDER FEB-2025

Ryan Swaine <ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk> 18 February 2025 at 10:55
Reply-To: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
To: Kate Giriffitths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>, Agib Majeed <agib.majeed@viamed.co.uk>, Sophie Lines <sophie.lines@viamed.co.uk>

Hi, please can we send them a proforma invoice.

Thank you, Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Phwong Thai Thi Trinh <trinhphuong@anantrading.vn>
Date: Tue, 18 Feb 2025 at 04:08

Subject: NEW ORDER FEB-2025

To: <ryan.swaine@yviamed.co.uk>

Dear Ryan,

| want to order some sensors as below detail:
OOM111-M: 18pcs

R-49V: 15pcs

R-17Med: O4pcs

R-22AVG: 20pcs

Certificate of origin is required.

Please send me proformation.

Thank you & Best Regards,

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=07ddd72f30&view=pt&search=all&permmsgid=msg-f: 182439239587 1964099&simpl=msg-f: 182439239587 1964099&mb=1 12



2/18/25, 11:47 AM Gmail - Fwd: NEW ORDER FEB-2025
Ms. Trinh Phuong

An An Import Export Co.,Ltd
109/11/19 4th Street, 16th Ward, Go Vap Dist, Ho Chi Minh City, VN
Tel: +84 987 546 072

Email: TrinhPhuong@anantrading.vn
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