14/02/2025, 11:24 Gmail - Re: R-33VAN 140225VANDAGRAPH

M Gma" Ryan Swaine <viamed.ryan.swaine@gmail.com>

Re: R-33VAN 140225VANDAGRAPH

1 message

FARRIS PASK <farris@chambersoceanics.com> 14 February 2025 at 10:15
To: ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Cc: Mike Chambers <mike@chambersoceanics.com>, Matt <matt@chambersoceanics.com>

Morning Ryan

Please could we take 3 units

R-33VAN = £50 each EXW

Order No. 140225VANDAGRAPH

Best Regards,

Accounts

“Deeply Committed”

Worldwide Manufacturers-Suppliers-Rental Of Commercial Diving, Rov, Marine Equipment /
Equipment Brokers-Agents / Onshore-Offshore Site Auditors

Tel: +44 (0)1482 876999

Mobile: 07772051139

Email: farris@chambersoceanics.com

Website: www.chambersoceanics.com

WPy MORG

Chambers Oceanics Ltd: Registered in England, Reg. No: GB 4305147.
Registered Address: CHAMBERS OCEANICS LTD, HARPINGS ROAD, HULL, HU5 4JF
Engineering/Workshop: CHAMBERS OCEANICS LTD, HARPINGS ROAD, HULL, HU5 4JF

The information contained in this e-mail may contain confidential or privileged material and is intended only for the stated addressee(s). If you are not a
valid addressee, the use, disclosure, copying or distribution of this information is prohibited and may be unlawful. If you have received this message in
error, please notify the sender immediately and delete all copies of the message from your computer. All information or opinions expressed in this
message and/or any attachments are those of the author and are not necessarily those of Chambers Oceanics Ltd.
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From: Ryan Swaine <ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk>
Sent: 14 February 2025 09:57

To: Matt <matt@chambersoceanics.com>

Cc: Mike Chambers <mike@chambersoceanics.com>
Subject: Re: R-33VAN

Hi Matt

Thank you for your email.

R-33VAN = £50 each EXW

Available from stock.

Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

General Manager
VANDAGRAPH Ltd.

http://www.vandagraph.co.uk

Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900

Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

On Fri, 14 Feb 2025 at 09:39, Matt <matt@chambersoceanics.com> wrote:

Ryan,

Can you please provide a quotation for the following:

3 x R-33VAN

Availability and discounts on offer.

Kind Regards
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Matthew Ward

CHAMBERS
OCEANICS
~—

“Deeply Committed”

Tel: +44 (0)1482 876999

Mobile: +44 (0)7398284041

Email: matt@chambersoceanics.com
Website: www.chambersoceanics.com
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