2/4/25, 3:04 PM Gmail - Fwd: FZE808 |OXYGEN ANALYZER |VIAMED
M Gma" Aqib Majeed <viamed.aqib.majeed@gmail.com>

Fwd: FZE808 |[OXYGEN ANALYZER |VIAMED

Ryan Swaine <ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk> 4 February 2025 at 14:48
Reply-To: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk

To: Kate Griffitths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>, Aqib Majeed <aqib.majeed@viamed.co.uk>, Sophie Lines
<sophie.lines@viamed.co.uk>

Hi, please can we provide Mavis with a proforma invoice for 5x Ultramax analysers, | will sort out the compliance sheet.
Thank you, Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: MAVIS ADJEI <mavis@afrimed.biz>

Date: Tue, 4 Feb 2025 at 12:43

Subject: FZE808 |[OXYGEN ANALYZER |VIAMED
To: <ryan.swaine@yviamed.co.uk>

Dear Sir,

Trust you are well and wishing you a happy New Year.

This is Mavis from Afrimed Medical Supplies.

We have a request for 5 units of Ultramax02 oxygen analyzers to Ghana.
Kindly assist us with

1. Price quotation

2. Freight charges to Kotoka International Airport.

3. HS code

4. Shipment weight and volume

5. Filled Compliance sheet (attached)

We look forward to receiving your prompt response.

Regards.
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