
Ryan Swaine <viamed.ryan.swaine@gmail.com>

Re: Small order
1 message

Tech Gas Asia <info@techgasasia.com> 31 January 2025 at 22:14
To: Ryan Swaine <ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk>

Ryan thanks
The quick is the blue flow adapter correct ? Pls have that in the box. 

Thanks 
U have our credit card details yea ? 

Dave 

Sent from my iPhone

On 31 Jan 2025, at 8:14 PM, Ryan Swaine <ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk> wrote:

Hi Dave

I think we can do it, do you need a quick ox or din kit with it?

Best regards
Ryan
Ryan Swaine
General Manager
VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk
Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900
Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

On Fri, 31 Jan 2025 at 12:04, Tech Gas Asia <info@techgasasia.com> wrote:
Ryan
Is it too late to add a MKII VN202 non Auto shut. 

Pls assist to add one u it or that 
Thanks 

Dave 

Sent from my iPhone

On 30 Jan 2025, at 11:18 PM, Ryan Swaine <ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk> wrote:

﻿
Thank you

Ryan Swaine
General Manager
VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk
Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900
Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

On Thu, 30 Jan 2025 at 14:25, Tech Gas Asia <info@techgasasia.com> wrote:
Thanks Ryan
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Can you use the usual credit card for the booking as a TA the Chinese new years here and office
is closed till sat 

Sent from my iPhone

On 30 Jan 2025, at 5:30 PM, Ryan Swaine <ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk>
wrote:

﻿
Hi

Thank you very much for your order, please find your proforma invoice attached.

Best regards
Ryan

Ryan Swaine
General Manager
VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk
Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900
Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

On Thu, 30 Jan 2025 at 07:47, Tech Gas Asia <info@techgasasia.com> wrote:

Hi Ryan

Can I make an order for 5 pieces of sensors replacement for analox O2EII pls

Thanks

Sent from my iPhone
<MAN154737.pdf>
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