
Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

Fwd: Order-Justec-20250123001
1 message

Ryan Swaine <ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk> 23 January 2025 at 13:45
Reply-To: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
To: Kate Griffitths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>, Aqib Majeed <aqib.majeed@viamed.co.uk>, Sophie Lines
<sophie.lines@viamed.co.uk>

Hi, please can we process two orders for Justec.

Order 1 to be dispatched after 7th February
30pcs UFO 130-2 with boxes
100pcs R-23V (bulk packed) without boxes with special price as per memo. 
The date of manufacture must be 2025.

Order 2 to be dispatched 14th-18th April
20pcs UFO 130-2 with boxes
100pcs R-23V (bulk packed) without boxes with special price as per memo. 
The date of manufacture must be 2025. 

Thank you, Ryan

Ryan Swaine
International Sales Manager
VIAMED
www.viamed.co.uk
Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy 

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: ‪‪‪tracy.wang@justec.cn‬‬‬ <tracy.wang@justec.cn>
Date: Thu, 23 Jan 2025 at 11:19
Subject: 回复：Order-Justec-20250123001
To: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk <ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk>
Cc: elaine.zhao <elaine.zhao@justec.cn>

Hello Ryan,

Would it be possible to get them earlier?

We need the first batch in the middle of February.
And we need the second batch is about at the end of April.

Looking forward to your early reply.

And please note that our Chinese New Year holiday is from 24 January to 6 February.If you have any problem
during this period, please leave message to us, we will return to work on 7 February. 

Best Regards,
Tracy 
 
Justec Shenzhen Co., Ltd.
2F,Building 64,Majialong Industry Zone, Nanshan, Shenzhen,China,518054
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TEL：0755－26068930/1/2  —8023 Fax: 0755-26068933

-------- 原始邮件 --------
发件人： Ryan Swaine <ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk>
日期： 2025年1月23日周四 18:13
收件人： tracy.wang@justec.cn
抄送： "elaine.zhao" <elaine.zhao@justec.cn>
主 题： Re: Order-Justec-20250123001
Hi Tracy

Thank you very much.

I can confirm that we can offer you the special prices once again for the R-23V sensors.

1st delivery: We can aim for March
2nd delivery: We can plan this for the end of June or before, but we would need an idea of when you will require them
in order to plan production. If we add June for the time being, would that be okay?

Best regards
Ryan

Ryan Swaine
International Sales Manager
VIAMED
www.viamed.co.uk
Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy 

On Thu, 23 Jan 2025 at 01:36, tracy.wang@justec.cn <tracy.wang@justec.cn> wrote:
Hello Ryan,

Please find attached our new order-20250123001. We need 50pcs UFO 130-2 with boxes and 200pcs R-23V
without boxes.
And we need them in batches:

1.Please ship 30pcs UFO 130-2 with boxes and 100pcs R-23V without boxes to us after 7
th

 February 2025. The date

of manufacture must be 2025.

2.Please ship 20pcs UFO 130-2 with boxes and 100pcs R-23V without boxes to us after you got our notification. The

date of manufacture must be 2025. 

Thanks.
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Our Chinese New Year holiday is from 24 January to 6 February and we will return to
work on 7 February. 

Best Regards,
Tracy 
 
Justec Shenzhen Co., Ltd.
2F,Building 64,Majialong Industry Zone, Nanshan, Shenzhen,China,518054
TEL：0755－26068930/1/2  —8023 Fax: 0755-26068933
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