
Ryan Swaine <viamed.ryan.swaine@gmail.com>

VS: R-17VAN Oxygen Sensor (0110217)
1 message

Sami Pöllänen <sami@osa.fi> 17 January 2025 at 07:10
To: Michael Lamb <michael.lamb@vandagraph.co.uk>

Hello,

 

Information below:

 

Contact Name                                                  Sami Pöllänen

Email                                                                   sami@osa.fi

Phone Number                                                  +358408680505

 

Delivery Address                                              Ruunikkokatu 12, 20380 Turku, Finland

Invoice Address                                                laskut@osa.fi

 

 

Ystävällisin terveisin / Best Regards

Sami Pöllänen

+ 358 40 8680 505

sami@osa.fi

 

 

 

Lähettäjä: Michael Lamb <michael.lamb@vandagraph.co.uk>
Lähetetty: keskiviikko 15. tammikuuta 2025 16:42
Vastaanottaja: Sami Pöllänen <sami@osa.fi>
Kopio: sales@vandagraph.co.uk
Aihe: Re: R-17VAN Oxygen Sensor (0110217)

 

Good Afternoon,

 

Thank you for your inquiry,
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Our R-17VAN sensors are priced at £38 GBP each

 

I believe Carriage costs to Finland would be about 20GBP but I cannot be certain without the full delivery address.

If you would like, if you can give me the details below I can provide you with a Proforma Invoice showing the complete
cost of your order.

 
Contact Name
Email
Phone Number

Delivery Address

Invoice Address

And the quantity of stock that you require 

 

Bear in mind that there will also be customs charges that we unfortunately do not have control over.

 

If you have any other questions please let me know.

 

Kind regards

Michael

 

Michael Lamb

Vandagraph Ltd.

http://www.vandagraph.co.uk
Email michael.lamb@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900

 

 

On Wed, 15 Jan 2025 at 10:43, Sami Pöllänen <sami@osa.fi> wrote:

Hello,

 

what would be the price if we take 10 pcs of R-17VAN Oxygen Sensor (0110217).

And what would be delivery time and delivery cost?

 

Thank you in advance.

 

Ystävällisin terveisin / Best Regards

Sami Pöllänen
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+ 358 40 8680 505

sami@osa.fi
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