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M Gma" Michael Lamb <viamed.michael.lamb@gmail.com>

New order, mlinke 14 1 2025

Mariusz z mlinke.eu <sklep@mariuszlinke.pl> 14 January 2025 at 14:48

To: ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk

Good morning,

I'd like to make new order:

- sensor R-17 VAN - 5 pcs

- sensor R-22 VAN - 2 pcs

- sensor R-33 DE - 2 pcs

Could you send me an invoice for payment.

I'd rather you send me all sensors with the most appropriate date for expiry.

Best regards,
mlinke ;)

sklep@mariuszlinke.pl

facebook: mlinke sidemount
tel. 0048 793 540 230
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www.mlinke.eu

Wystaw opinie o naszej firmie w Google tutaj: dodaj opinie Google!

Ta wiadomos$¢ e-mail jest wolna od wiruséw i zto$liwego oprogramowania,
poniewaz ochrona ESET NOD32 Antivirus jest aktywna.

Otrzymana wiadomosc¢ jest poufna i stanowi tajemnice przedsiebiorstwa. Nie wolno jej ujawnia¢ osobom trzecim.

This message is confidential and a business secret. The contents may not be disclosed to third parties.

Pomysl o Srodowisku! Nie drukuj tej wiadomoSci jesli nie jest to konieczne.

W dniu 24-10-2024 10:29, Ryan Swaine napisat(a):

Dear Mariusz

Thank you very much for your order, please find your proforma invoice attached.
We will check the stock for you, but | am sure we do not have any R-17VAN sensors that would be considered
old.

Best regards
Ryan
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Ryan Swaine

General Manager

VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk

Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900

Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

On Thu, 24 Oct 2024 at 07:41, Mariusz z mlinke.eu <sklep@mariuszlinke.pl> wrote:
Good morning,
I'd like to make new order:
- sensor R-17 VAN - 9 pcs
Could you send me an invoice for payment?
I'd rather you send me all sensors with the most appropriate date for expiry.

Best regards,
mlinke ;)

sklep@mariuszlinke.pl

facebook: mlinke sidemount
tel. 0048 793 540 230
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Wystaw opinie o naszej firmie w Google tutaj: dodaj opinie Google!

Ta wiadomos¢ e-mail jest wolna od wiruséw i ztosliwego oprogramowania,
poniewaz ochrona ESET NOD32 Antivirus jest aktywna.

Otrzymana wiadomosc¢ jest poufna i stanowi tajemnice przedsiebiorstwa. Nie wolno jej ujawnia¢ osobom
trzecim.
This message is confidential and a business secret. The contents may not be disclosed to third parties.

Pomysl o srodowisku! Nie drukuj tej wiadomo$ci jesli nie jest to konieczne.

W dniu 26-09-2024 22:01, Michael Lamb napisat(a):
Please find attached Vandagraph Invoice(s) RAN152430-1.pdf

Should you have any queries please do not hesitate to contact us at accounts@vandagraph.co.uk
Kind Regards

Michael Lamb
michael.lamb@vandagraph.co.uk
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