1/13/25, 1:00 PM Gmail - Re: Proforma invoice as requested

M Gma” Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

Re: Proforma invoice as requested
1 message

David Clarke <david.clarke@vetsltd.uk> 13 January 2025 at 12:34
To: Kate Griffiths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>

Hi Kate
Yes | would like to go ahead
Best regards

David Clarke

Veterinary Equipment Technical Services
(Trading name of Medical Equipment Technical Services)
Townend Cottage

North Street

Haworth

Keighley

West Yorkshire

BD21 5QX

m: 07736060803

e: david.clarke@vetsltd.uk

On Mon, 13 Jan 2025 at 12:20, Kate Griffiths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Good afternoon David,

Further to our telephone conversation just now, please see attached proforma invoice for the T piece to
be used with the Handi+

You will see this is a pack of five. As the packet is CE marked as a pack of five, we are legally obliged
to sell them in that way and we are unable to sell these individually.

If you would like to proceed, please let me know and | will arrange for an email to be sent to you for
payment via Square.

You would then be able to collect this tomorrow.
Many thanks.

Kind regards

Kate Griffiths

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
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Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office.
Telephone calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use email where possible.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted
to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please
reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542
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