
Ryan Swaine <viamed.ryan.swaine@gmail.com>

Re: inquiry : oxygen sensors // awaiting proforma invoice
1 message

Subcompresseur <subcompresseur@wanadoo.fr> 10 January 2025 at 14:22
To: ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Cc: Michael Lamb <michael.lamb@vandagraph.co.uk>

Hello Ryan,

many thanks for your prompt answer concerning our inquiry.

We would appreciate to receive your proforma invoice for the supply of 3 (three) sensors and the carriage to France.
So we could settle down the payment before delivery.

Best regards

Mr M. ORMAYER

Le 10/01/2025 à 14:46, Ryan Swaine a écrit :

Dear Mr. Ormayer

Thank you very much for your email.

MAX-250+ = GBP £88 each EXW
Carriage to France = £13

We have the sensors available from stock, dispatch would be 1-2 days from receipt of payment. 
Please let me know if you would like to proceed with the order and we will send you a proforma invoice.

Best regards
Ryan

Ryan Swaine
General Manager
VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk
Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900
Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

On Fri, 10 Jan 2025 at 13:29, Subcompresseur <subcompresseur@wanadoo.fr> wrote:

Dear sirs,

we please you to transmit us your best offer of price and delay for the supply of :

3 pieces Maxtec Max-250 + oxygen sensor for Maxtec for replacement, modèle R125P02-
011

delivered to France

Best regards

Mr M. ORMAYER
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(owner)

STELLA MARE

109 allée du Pousset

83400 HYERES / FRANCE

VAT number : FR87332292440

EORI number : FR33229244000028
--

--
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