
Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

Re: Purchase Order #UNI-8635
1 message

Kate Griffiths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk> 7 January 2025 at 11:01
To: Şeyda AKBAL | UNIARCH <seyda.akbal@uniarch.com.tr>, Ryan Swaine <ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk>
Cc: Nergis KILIÇ | UNIARCH <nergis.kilic@uniarch.com.tr>, Alper KÜNEY | UNIARCH <alper.kuney@uniarch.com.tr>,
"operasyon@alfaanka.com" <operasyon@alfaanka.com>
Bcc: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com>

Good morning,

Thank you for your payment.

The lead time would be approximately the end of February.  We will of course ship as soon as stock becomes
available.

I will update the order confirmation to show the same as the invoice address:

I will email the order confirmation shortly.

Kind regards

Kate Griffiths
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On Tue, 7 Jan 2025 at 10:32, Şeyda AKBAL | UNIARCH <seyda.akbal@uniarch.com.tr> wrote:
Hi Kate,

Payment has been made, the receipt is attached. We kindly request your feedback regarding the
delivery time. Delivery information is listed below.
We kindly request you to send us the invoice with the order number added.

Shipping and billing addresses are the same.

Address:
Uniarch Klinik Mühendislik ve Klinik Alanı Tasarım Hizmetleri SAN. ve TİC. A.Ş.
Çavuşoğlu District Yakacık Street. Number:130 UNIARCH Building, 34873 Kartal/Istanbul
Delivery Person: Şeyda Kaba +90531 464 71 03
Tax Office:KARTAL
Tax Number :8920335606 

Best Regards,

  Şeyda AKBAL
Biyomedikal Mühendisi
E-posta seyda.akbal@uniarch.com.tr

Cep Telefonu 0531 464 71 03

Telefon 0850 307 0864

Merkez Çavuşoğlu Mh. Yakacık Cd. No:130 Kartal/İstanbul

Şube

 

www.uniarch.com.tr  |  LinkedIn

Gönderen: Kate Griffiths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>
Gönderildi: 7 Ocak 2025 Salı 12:18
Kime: Şeyda AKBAL | UNIARCH <seyda.akbal@uniarch.com.tr>
Bilgi: Nergis KILIÇ | UNIARCH <nergis.kilic@uniarch.com.tr>; Alper KÜNEY | UNIARCH
<alper.kuney@uniarch.com.tr>; operasyon@alfaanka.com <operasyon@alfaanka.com>
Konu: Re: Purchase Order #UNI-8635
 
Good morning,

Thank you for your purchase order.

Please see attached updated proforma invoice with PO number added and invoice address changed.

Many thanks.

Kind regards

Kate Griffiths
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On Tue, 7 Jan 2025 at 06:47, Şeyda AKBAL | UNIARCH <seyda.akbal@uniarch.com.tr> wrote:
Dear Kate;

Attached is our approval based on the offer you have forwarded to us.

We kindly request you to add our order number (UNI-8635) specified in the attached order form to
your invoice, as invoices without order numbers cannot be processed.

Additionally, we would appreciate it if you could confirm the delivery time at your earliest
convenience. For your reference, our current invoice information is as follows:

Address:
Uniarch Klinik Mühendislik ve Klinik Alanı Tasarım Hizmetleri SAN. ve TİC. A.Ş.
Çavuşoğlu District, Yakacık Street, No: 130 UNIARCH Building, 34873 Kartal/Istanbul
Şeyda Kaba
+90 531 464 71 03
Tax Office: KARTAL
Tax Number: 8920335606

Thank you for your attention, and we look forward to your response as soon as possible.

Best regards,

  Şeyda AKBAL
Biyomedikal Mühendisi
E-posta seyda.akbal@uniarch.com.tr

Cep Telefonu 0531 464 71 03

Telefon 0850 307 0864

Merkez Çavuşoğlu Mh. Yakacık Cd. No:130 Kartal/İstanbul

Şube
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