
Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

Fwd: About Turkey
1 message

Ryan Swaine <ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk> 3 January 2025 at 13:54
Reply-To: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
To: Kate Griffitths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>, Aqib Majeed <aqib.majeed@viamed.co.uk>, Sophie Lines
<sophie.lines@viamed.co.uk>

Hi, please can we send a proforma (account CID31261) for the following items:

1x 4310007
1x 4310009

Thank you
Ryan

Ryan Swaine
International Sales Manager
VIAMED
www.viamed.co.uk
Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy 

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: Fatih Koldankaya <fatihk@aedglobalhealth.com>
Date: Mon, 30 Dec 2024 at 18:47
Subject: About Turkey
To: <ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk>
Cc: <nergis.kilic@uniarch.com.tr>

Dear Ryan,

 

We want to order and try each package of flow sensors with the attached catalog. Can you send us a proforma
invoice for this? I would appreciate it if you can send it after the New Year. Can you also share the CE certificate of
these products, if any? If not, you can send the exemption letter. Thank you for your help for now.

My partner whose email you saw in CC will help us with the import. We will do the import through the
company she specified.

 

I wish you a happy new year againJ

 

Thanks and regards.

 

Fatih.
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From: Ryan Swaine <ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk>
Sent: Friday, December 27, 2024 7:18 PM
To: Fatih <fatihk@aedglobalhealth.com>
Subject: Re: Webex meeting changed: Catch up for Turkey

 

Dear Fatih

 

Unfortunately I do not currently have a comprehensive price list for our O2 sensors, as the range has been expanded
recently. Can I please suggest that you give me an idea of the sensors your clients need; if you can give me the
makes and models of sensors or of the equipment you require the sensors for I can give you the pricing information?

 

Please find the pricing for the Versastream lines and Flow sensors attached, but again it might be better to give us an
idea of what your clients are currently using before purchasing samples?

 

Best regards

Ryan

 

 

Ryan Swaine
International Sales Manager
VIAMED
www.viamed.co.uk
Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542

Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

 

2 attachments

USD Distributor Price List - Flow Sensors ID104916.pdf
87K

SpiroTrue Flowsensor Leaflet ID119548.pdf
310K

03/01/2025, 14:03 Gmail - Fwd: About Turkey

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=b5871a5be0&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f:1820236149838011861%7Cmsg-f:1820236149838011… 2/2

mailto:ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
mailto:fatihk@aedglobalhealth.com
http://www.viamed.co.uk/
mailto:ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ui=2&ik=b5871a5be0&view=att&th=1942c7225e6b5dd5&attid=0.1&disp=attd&realattid=1942c6d8b4a1f7d20561&safe=1&zw
https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ui=2&ik=b5871a5be0&view=att&th=1942c7225e6b5dd5&attid=0.1&disp=attd&realattid=1942c6d8b4a1f7d20561&safe=1&zw
https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ui=2&ik=b5871a5be0&view=att&th=1942c7225e6b5dd5&attid=0.2&disp=attd&realattid=1942c6d8b4a2c78eff12&safe=1&zw
https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ui=2&ik=b5871a5be0&view=att&th=1942c7225e6b5dd5&attid=0.2&disp=attd&realattid=1942c6d8b4a2c78eff12&safe=1&zw

