
Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

Fwd: Medicalsolutionsystem/SMARTsat OEM1 & 2 need
1 message

Ryan Swaine <ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk> 20 December 2024 at 13:46
Reply-To: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
To: Kate Griffitths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>, Aqib Majeed <aqib.majeed@viamed.co.uk>, Sophie Lines
<sophie.lines@viamed.co.uk>

Hi
Please can we send a proforma invoice, account CID31335 for the following items:

0012764 OEM II Development Kit (includes sensor) = EUR €450
0012711 OEM SpO2 board - SMARTsat OEM II = €95
0014850 Pulse Oximetry Ear Sensor = €80

Thank you, Ryan

Ryan Swaine
International Sales Manager
VIAMED
www.viamed.co.uk
Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy 

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: 강민수 <mandolli97@naver.com>
Date: Tue, 17 Dec 2024 at 00:52
Subject: Re: Medicalsolutionsystem/SMARTsat OEM1 & 2 need
To: <ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk>

Dear Swaine ,

 

We have checked the data you sent us. We need the OEM 2 Development Kit (0012761): 8110140010 and an
additional OEM 2 Module (911010001xx 1EA, Ear Probe SpO2 sensor EP7500: 602132254 1EA.Based on the
 OEM 2 Module, we would like to develop a portable type system.

 

The system we are developing  is a wearable pulse oximeter that can communicate with Wi-Fi  applied to the
gait analysis system, and it must have high mobility as it is a device that allows the patient to walk while
wearing it,   and it must adapt   to the low perfusion   situation as it is applied to elderly patients, so we
selected OEM2.

 

If you provide us with your prepayment passbook for the purchase of this product, we will transfer the money
to you.

 Please send the product to the address below.

MEDICAL SOLUTION SYSTEM

KANG, MINSOO

 Inje University Creation Hall (B Building) Room 425, 197 Inje-ro, Gimhae-si, Gyeongsangnam-do, Korea

Phone: +82-10-2229-7462
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Personal customs clearance number: P170017333372

 

I appreciate it.

-----Original Message-----
From: "Ryan Swaine"<ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk>
To: "강민수"<mandolli97@naver.com>;
Cc:
Sent: 2024-12-13 (금) 23:59:05 (GMT+09:00)
Subject: Re: Medicalsolutionsystem/SMARTsat OEM1 & 2 need

Dear Min Soo Kang

I hope this email finds you well. I apologise for my late reply.

Please find attached a copy of the countersigned agreement.

Additionally, I have included the Communication Protocol, Integration Guide and Host Validation Checklist for
your reference.

OEM II: Offers excellent performance under low perfusion conditions and great motion tolerance.
OEM III: Provides comparable motion tolerance, operates with lower power consumption, and has a
smaller footprint.

We are currently using the OEM III in our VM-2160 SMARTsat handheld device.

For your development team, we can provide a development kit that interfaces with a PC to allow evaluation of
the SMARTsat technology. Pricing details are as follows:

0012761 OEM II Development Kit: EUR €350 EXW
0012762 OEM III Development Kit: EUR €350 EXW

We can also offer an emulator for your software team to simulate patient signals, conditions, alarms, and
more. This can help demonstrate how SMARTsat interfaces with your existing hardware.

I look forward to hearing more about your requirements. Please do not hesitate to reach out if you have any
questions.

Best regards
Ryan

Ryan Swaine
International Sales Manager
VIAMED
www.viamed.co.uk
Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy 

On Fri, 6 Dec 2024 at 00:41, 강민수 <mandolli97@naver.com> wrote:
Dear Swaine ,

 

I will send it back to you with the date as shown in the attached file. 

 

I appreciate it.
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-----Original Message-----
From: "Ryan Swaine"<ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk>
To: "강민수"<mandolli97@naver.com>;
Cc:
Sent: 2024-12-05 (목) 19:27:55 (GMT+09:00)
Subject: Re: Medicalsolutionsystem/SMARTsat OEM1 & 2 need

Hi

Thank you very much, please can you fill in the date, today would be okay, at the top of the page:

image.png

Best regards
Ryan

Ryan Swaine
International Sales Manager
VIAMED
www.viamed.co.uk
Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy 

On Wed, 4 Dec 2024 at 02:26, 강민수 <mandolli97@naver.com> wrote:
Dear Swaine ,

 

I will send you the NDA document signed as an attachment.

 

Thank you for being with us.

 

I appreciate it.

-----------------------------------------------------------------

MEDICAL SOLUTION SYSTEM

 

            KANG, MIN SOO CEO

 

Headquarters: Inje University Creation Hall (B Building) Room 425, 197 Inje-ro, Gimhae-si, Gyeongsangnam-do,
Korea

H. 010-2229-7462

Home. www.medicalsolutionsystem.com

mail. mandolli97@naver.com

mail. mandolli@hotmail.com

-----Original Message-----
From: "Ryan Swaine"<ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk>
To: "강민수"<mandolli97@naver.com>;
Cc:

20/12/2024, 14:00 Gmail - Fwd: Medicalsolutionsystem/SMARTsat OEM1 & 2 need

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=b5871a5be0&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f:1818967335456804409%7Cmsg-f:1818967335456804… 3/5

mailto:ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
mailto:ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
mailto:mandolli97@naver.com
http://www.viamed.co.uk/
mailto:ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
http://www.viamed.co.uk/policy
mailto:mandolli97@naver.com
https://www.google.com/maps/search/197+Inje-ro,+Gimhae-si,+Gyeongsangnam-do,+Korea?entry=gmail&source=g
https://www.google.com/maps/search/197+Inje-ro,+Gimhae-si,+Gyeongsangnam-do,+Korea?entry=gmail&source=g
http://www.medicalsolutionsystem.com/
http://www.medicalsolutionsystem.com/
mailto:mandolli97@naver.com
mailto:mandolli@hotmail.com
mailto:ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
mailto:ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
mailto:mandolli97@naver.com


Sent: 2024-12-03 (화) 01:52:03 (GMT+09:00)
Subject: Re: Medicalsolutionsystem/SMARTsat OEM1 & 2 need

Dear Min Soo Kang

Thank you for your email and for taking the time to visit us at Medica. I apologise for the delay in
responding; it has been an incredibly busy period since the event.

Before I provide pricing and ordering information, could you kindly complete, sign, and return a scanned
copy of the attached non-disclosure agreement? This will enable us to discuss your requirements openly.

I look forward to hearing from you.

Best regards
Ryan

Ryan Swaine
International Sales Manager
VIAMED
www.viamed.co.uk
Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy 

On Wed, 20 Nov 2024 at 02:24, 강민수 <mandolli97@naver.com> wrote:
Dear Mr. Nixon,

 

I hope that you had a very successful MEDICA show this time!

As I mentioned at MEDICA, we need your module, the SMARTsat module.

 Therefore, I need OEM 1 and OEM 2 and the SMARTsat development kit.

How can I make a purchase and receive the item from my company in Korea?

Please discuss how.  I will actively reflect it in our products.

 

I appreciate it.

-----------------------------------------------------------------

MEDICAL SOLUTION SYSTEM

 

            KANG, MIN SOO CEO

 

Headquarters: Inje University Creation Hall (B Building) Room 425, 197 Inje-ro, Gimhae-si, Gyeongsangnam-
do, Korea

H. 010-2229-7462

Home. www.medicalsolutionsystem.com

mail. mandolli97@naver.com

mail. mandolli@hotmail.com
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