
Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

AW: Sensoranfrage AT-BK007863
1 message

Einkauf | esz AG <einkauf@esz-ag.de> 20 December 2024 at 12:34
To: Kate Griffiths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>

Hello Kate,

 

then please use PayPal.

 

Thank you

 

Kind regards

 

Mit freundlichen Grüßen

Andreas Lipp

Einkauf

Telefon: +49-8141-88887-168 | Fax: +49-8141-88887-78
E-Mail: a.lipp@esz-ag.de | Web: www.esz-ag.de

esz AG calibration & metrology Aufsichtsratsvorsitzender: Registergericht München: HRB 179122

Max-Planck-Straße 16 Dipl.-Ing. Siegfried Fleischmann Sitz der Gesellschaft: Eichenau

82223 Eichenau Vorstand: Steuernummer:

Dipl.-Kfm. Oliver T. Fleischmann Ust.-Id. DE128223184

Dipl.-Ing. Univ. Philip M. Fleischmann St.-Id. 117/120/20352

 

Werden Sie Teil des esz-Teams: Hier geht´s zu unseren aktuellen Stellenangeboten.

 

 

Von: Kate Griffiths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>
Gesendet: Freitag, 20. Dezember 2024 11:29
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An: Einkauf | esz AG <einkauf@esz-ag.de>
Betreff: Re: Sensoranfrage AT-BK007863

 

Good morning Andreas,

 

Thank you for your order.

 

We ask that export customers pay by bank transfer or PayPal.  PayPal incurs a 6% fee of the total order.

 

I will process a proforma invoice now for you.  Do you want me to use PayPal or are you able to pay by bank transfer?

 

Kind regards

 

Kate Griffiths

 

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

 

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

 

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

 

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone
calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use email where possible.

 

E-mail Disclaimer

-----------------

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in
reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

 

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with
delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

-----------------
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On Fri, 20 Dec 2024 at 10:21, Einkauf | esz AG <einkauf@esz-ag.de> wrote:

Good morning Kate,

 

Attached is our order for the R-17MED sensor.

 

Please send us an order confirmation.

 

Do we have to pay in advance? If I send you our credit card information, is that okay too?

 

Thank you very much.

 

Best regards

Andreas Lipp

Einkauf

Telefon: +49-8141-88887-168 | Fax: +49-8141-88887-78
E-Mail: a.lipp@esz-ag.de | Web: www.esz-ag.de

esz AG calibration & metrology Aufsichtsratsvorsitzender: Registergericht München: HRB 179122

Max-Planck-Straße 16 Dipl.-Ing. Siegfried Fleischmann Sitz der Gesellschaft: Eichenau

82223 Eichenau Vorstand: Steuernummer:

Dipl.-Kfm. Oliver T. Fleischmann Ust.-Id. DE128223184

Dipl.-Ing. Univ. Philip M. Fleischmann St.-Id. 117/120/20352

 

Werden Sie Teil des esz-Teams: Hier geht´s zu unseren aktuellen Stellenangeboten.

 

 

Von: Kate Griffiths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>
Gesendet: Donnerstag, 5. Dezember 2024 10:35
An: Einkauf | esz AG <einkauf@esz-ag.de>
Betreff: Re: Sensoranfrage AT-BK007863
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Good morning Andreas,

 

Thank you for your enquiry.

 

The price for part number 0110017 - R-17MED (suitable for the MX300 range) is €58.80 each EXW.

 

If you would like a proforma invoice detailing carriage charges and insurance, I would need your invoice and
delivery addresses.

 

Please let me know if I can be of any further assistance.

 

Many thanks.

 

Kind regards

 

Kate Griffiths

 

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

 

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

 

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

 

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone
calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use email where possible.

 

E-mail Disclaimer

-----------------

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken
in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.
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If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with
delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

-----------------

 

 

On Thu, 5 Dec 2024 at 09:21, Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

 

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: Einkauf | esz AG <einkauf@esz-ag.de>
Date: Wed, 4 Dec 2024 at 14:26
Subject: WG: Sensoranfrage AT-BK007863
To: office@viamed.co.uk <office@viamed.co.uk>

 

Dear Sir or Madam

 

We need a sensor for the following device

 

TELEDYNE Analytical Instruments MX 300-1. We had already ordered a sensor from you in 2021. Please find
attached the pictures.

 

It should be an R-17 MED sensor.

 

Please send us an offer. Do you also have a sales partner in Germany?

 

Thank you very much.

 

Best regards

Andreas Lipp

Einkauf

Telefon: +49-8141-88887-168 | Fax: +49-8141-88887-78
E-Mail: a.lipp@esz-ag.de | Web: www.esz-ag.de
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Werden Sie Teil des esz-Teams: Hier geht´s zu unseren aktuellen Stellenangeboten.

 

 

20/12/2024, 12:57 Gmail - AW: Sensoranfrage AT-BK007863

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=b5871a5be0&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f:1817591507064221532%7Cmsg-f:1818962740629087… 6/6

https://jobs.esz-ag.de/stellenangebote/

