12/6/24, 9:21 AM Gmail - Re: Proforma

M Gma" Aqib Majeed <viamed.aqib.majeed@gmail.com>

Re: Proforma

Roshil Mastermed <roshil@mastermed.info> 5 December 2024 at 20:22

To: Agib Majeed <viamed.aqgib.majeed@gmail.com>
Cc: Mastermed Equipment Trading LLC <mastermd@emirates.net.ae>, ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk

Dear Aqib,
Final update on proforma invoice
Please add following oxygen sensor too
R22Vi Oxygen sensor -QTY 6 PCS
Then please sign and stamp the proforma invoice
Thanks & regards

Roshil
MASTERMED

On Thu, Oct 24, 2024 at 1:00 PM Aqgib Majeed <viamed.aqgib.majeed@gmail.com> wrote:
Hello

Good morning

Thank you for your order.

Please see below for your attached your proforma invoice detailing the prices and product you require including
carriage costs.

Can you please have a look and see if all details on the proforma including addresses and are correct or if any
amendments are required.

| do need to advise the R-48V and the R-24med have both been superseded so | have used the alternatives which are
backwards compatible.

If your happy with the proforma and would like to proceed, could you please make payment of the Pl amount so we can
convert it to a order, you also owe us $110.68 from your orders in June and September as the wrong currency was paid
into our bank, | have attached the statements for your account for reference.

Please can the payment of $110.68 be made along side this proforma.

Please let me know if | can assist with anything else.
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Kind regards

Aqib Majeed
Office Administrator
Viamed Ltd.

http://www.viamed.co.uk

email: agib.majeed@viamed.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

Please note: Viamed is enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office.
Telephone calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use email where possible.

E-mail Disclaimer

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in
reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with
delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy
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