22/11/2024, 11:22

M Gmail

new order

greg@seaandsea.com.tw <greg@seaandsea.com.tw>
To: ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk

Hello Ryan,

| hope you everything are well.

We'd like to put a new order for following items.
5 x TEK-OX Auto

5x R-33DE
Do you have them in stock?

Best regards

Greg Chang

SEA&SEA Corp.

No. 252 Chang An West Road
Taipei 10341, Taiwan

886-2-25554360

From: Ryan Swaine <viamedinbox@gmail.com>
Sent: Friday, April 26, 2024 4:30 PM

To: greg@seaandsea.com.tw

Subject: Re: preparing new order

Hi Greg
You should receive the link very soon.
Thank you, Ryan

Ryan Swaine

General Manager
VANDAGRAPH Ltd.

Gmail - new order

Michael Lamb <viamed.michael.lamb@gmail.com>

22 November 2024 at 02:24
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http://www.vandagraph.co.uk

Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900

Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

On Fri, 26 Apr 2024 at 02:29, <greg@seaandsea.com.tw> wrote:
Hello Ryan,
Thanks for your reply.

Since the amount are not very big, please send me the payment link for card.

Best regards

Greg Chang

SEA&SEA Corp.

No. 252 Chang An West Road
Taipei 10341, Taiwan

886-2-25554360

From: Ryan Swaine <viamedinbox@gmail.com>
Sent: Thursday, April 25, 2024 6:17 PM

To: greg@seaandsea.com.tw

Subject: Re: preparing new order

Dear Greg

Thank you very much for your email.

Please find your proforma invoice attached.

Our bank details are listed at the bottom of the invoice or | can send you a payment link if you would prefer to use a
card.

Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine
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General Manager
VANDAGRAPH Ltd.

http://www.vandagraph.co.uk
Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900
Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

On Thu, 25 Apr 2024 at 09:31, <greg@seaandsea.com.tw> wrote:
Dear Ryan,
We would like to put new order as following.
10 x TEK-OX Auto

5x R-33DE

Would you please prepare these for us?

Best regards

Greg Chang

SEA&SEA Corp.

No. 252 Chang An West Road
Taipei 10341, Taiwan

886-2-25554360

From: Ryan Swaine <viamedinbox@gmail.com>
Sent: Thursday, April 18, 2024 4:23 PM

To: greg@seaandsea.com.tw

Subject: Re: preparing new order

Hi Greg

| am very well, thank you very much, | hope you are too.

We supply the sensors in a sealed bag, similar to Analox. The warranty is 12 months from the date of invoice.

Best regards

Ryan
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Ryan Swaine

General Manager
VANDAGRAPH Ltd.

http://www.vandagraph.co.uk
Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900
Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

On Thu, 18 Apr 2024 at 03:24, <greg@seaandsea.com.tw> wrote:
Dear Ryan,

| hope you everything are well.

We're going to have a new order for the 02 analyzers very soon.

Since we used to be Analox dealer, we think we would need some sensors for customer service.
Would you please confirm about how the warranty would work for sensors for Analox?

And how’s the packing for sensor would be?

When we import sensors from Analox, they’re all in vacuum package for extending life.

| wonder if you have such design?

Best regards

Greg Chang

SEA&SEA Corp.

No. 252 Chang An West Road
Taipei 10341, Taiwan

886-2-25554360
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