11/18/24, 1:18 PM Gmail - Fwd: O2 Cell M11 For SOPHIE and STEPHANIE Ventilators
M Gl na |I Aqib Majeed <viamed.aqib.majeed@gmail.com>

Fwd: O2 Cell M11 For SOPHIE and STEPHANIE Ventilators

Ryan Swaine <ryan.swaine@yviamed.co.uk> 18 November 2024 at 12:55
Reply-To: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
To: Kate Giriffitths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>, Aqib Majeed <agib.majeed@yviamed.co.uk>, Sophie Lines <sophie.lines@viamed.co.uk>

Hi, please can we send them a proforma invoice for 2x R-42V with a square payment link.

Thank you
Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Hanan Al-Shawabkeh <tenders@sadafmedical.com>

Date: Mon, 18 Nov 2024 at 12:17

Subject: RE: O2 Cell M11 For SOPHIE and STEPHANIE Ventilators

To: <ryan.swaine@yviamed.co.uk>

Cc: <info@sadafmedical.com>, <mutaz@sadafmedical.com>, Osama ahmad <service@sadafmedical.com>

Dear Ryan,

Kindly send us the Link.

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=07ddd72f30&view=pt&search=all&permmsgid=msg-f: 18 1606500308996 778 1&simpl=msg-f: 1816065003089967781&mb=1 1/8
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Best Regards,

Hanan Al-Shawabkeh

Head of Tenders Department

(Sins

Sadaf for Medical Supplies Est..

67 Amer bin Malek street,1st floor
Khalda,P.O Box 4412 , Amman ,11953 Jordan
Tel: +962 6 5333678

Fax: +962 6 5330100

From: Ryan Swaine <ryan.swaine@yviamed.co.uk>

Sent: Monday, November 18, 2024 1:54 PM

To: Hanan Al-Shawabkeh <tenders@sadafmedical.com>

Cc: mutaz@sadafmedical.com; Osama ahmad <service@sadafmedical.com>
Subject: Re: O2 Cell M11 For SOPHIE and STEPHANIE Ventilators

Dear Hanan

We can accept paypal, but it is costly so we would have to add the charges to the invoice. Alternatively we can send you a link if you wish to make a card payment?

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=07ddd72f30&view=pt&search=all&permmsgid=msg-f: 18 1606500308996 778 1&simpl=msg-f: 1816065003089967781&mb=1 2/8
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Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542

Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Mon, 18 Nov 2024 at 10:38, Hanan Al-Shawabkeh <tenders@sadafmedical.com> wrote:

Dear Rayan,

Since the value is very small, how we can pay for it? Do you have a PayPal?

Best Regards,

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=07ddd72f30&view=pt&search=all&permmsgid=msg-f: 18 1606500308996 778 1&simpl=msg-f: 1816065003089967781&mb=1 3/8
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Hanan Al-Shawabkeh

Head of Tenders Department

(Sins

Sadaf for Medical Supplies Est..

67 Amer bin Malek street, 1st floor
Khalda,P.O Box 4412 , Amman ,11953 Jordan
Tel: +962 6 5333678

Fax: +962 6 5330100

From: Ryan Swaine <ryan.swaine@yviamed.co.uk>

Sent: Monday, November 18, 2024 1:34 PM

To: Hanan Al-Shawabkeh <tenders@sadafmedical.com>

Cc: mutaz@sadafmedical.com; Osama ahmad <service@sadafmedical.com>
Subject: Re: 02 Cell M11 For SOPHIE and STEPHANIE Ventilators

Dear Hanan
Should we send you a proforma invoice for 2 pieces?

Best regards

Ryan

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=07ddd72f30&view=pt&search=all&permmsgid=msg-f: 18 1606500308996 778 1&simpl=msg-f: 1816065003089967781&mb=1 4/8
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Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542

Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Mon, 18 Nov 2024 at 10:22, Hanan Al-Shawabkeh <tenders@sadafmedical.com> wrote:
Dear Rayan,
Many thanks for your response.

Kindly be informed we need 2 pcs to check the compatibility with our customer and for evaluation, based on the evaluation we will place an order.

Best Regards,

Hanan Al-Shawabkeh

Head of Tenders Department

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=07ddd72f30&view=pt&search=all&permmsgid=msg-f: 18 1606500308996 778 1&simpl=msg-f: 1816065003089967781&mb=1 5/8



11/18/24, 1:18 PM Gmail - Fwd: O2 Cell M11 For SOPHIE and STEPHANIE Ventilators

Sadaf for Medical Supplies Est..

67 Amer bin Malek street, 1st floor
Khalda,P.O Box 4412 , Amman ,11953 Jordan
Tel: +962 6 5333678

Fax: +962 6 5330100

From: Ryan Swaine <ryan.swaine@yviamed.co.uk>

Sent: Monday, November 18, 2024 12:49 PM

To: Hanan Al-Shawabkeh <tenders@sadafmedical.com>

Cc: mutaz@sadafmedical.com; Osama ahmad <service@sadafmedical.com>
Subject: Re: 02 Cell M11 For SOPHIE and STEPHANIE Ventilators

Dear Hanan
Thank you very much for your email.

The sensor you require is as follows:

0110042 Oxygen sensor R-42V = USD $40

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=07ddd72f30&view=pt&search=all&permmsgid=msg-f: 18 1606500308996 778 1&simpl=msg-f: 1816065003089967781&mb=1 6/8
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We have a small amount of stock available.

Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542

Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Sun, 17 Nov 2024 at 10:16, Hanan Al-Shawabkeh <tenders@sadafmedical.com> wrote:

Dear Rayan,

Hope you are doing well.

Kindly be informed that we have a request for O2 Cell M11 For SOPHIE and STEPHANIE Ventilators, so kindly ask you to send us samples for your item
which compatible to our customer request ASAP.

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=07ddd72f30&view=pt&search=all&permmsgid=msg-f: 18 1606500308996 778 1&simpl=msg-f: 1816065003089967781&mb=1 718
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Best Regards,

Hanan Al-Shawabkeh

Head of Tenders Department

(Gms

Sadaf for Medical Supplies Est..

67 Amer bin Malek street, 1st floor
Khalda,P.O Box 4412 , Amman ,11953 Jordan
Tel: +962 6 5333678

Fax: +962 6 5330100

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=07ddd72f30&view=pt&search=all&permmsgid=msg-f: 18 1606500308996 778 1&simpl=msg-f: 1816065003089967781&mb=1 8/8



