
Sophie Lines <viamed.sophie.lines@gmail.com>

VS: Hus price inquiry
1 message

Ruohonen Toni <toni.ruohonen@hus.fi> Fri, Nov 15, 2024 at 10:43 AM
To: Sophie Lines <sophie.lines@viamed.co.uk>

Hi,

 

client wants 5 pieces: Mikrostim DB3 Patienti Lead 0.9m- Press Stud| |REF: 2520000

 

Can you give the price?

 

Thank you.

 

Ystävällisin terveisin

Toni Ruohonen

Ostaja / Buyer

 

HUS, Runkopalvelut, Materiaalinhallinta

PL 441, 00029 HUS | Uutistie 5, Vantaa

Toni.Ruohonen@Hus.fi

 

Lähettäjä: Sophie Lines <sophie.lines@viamed.co.uk>
Lähetetty: perjantai 15. marraskuuta 2024 12.01
Vastaanottaja: Ruohonen Toni <toni.ruohonen@hus.fi>
Aihe: Re: Hus price inquiry

 

Hi Toni, 

 

I have spoken with our finance department and they have agreed we can send an order without receiving payment up front, 
as long as the value of the order does not exceed €500. Please can you let me know how many cables you would like to
purchase? I will send you a quotation first just so you can double check all the details are correct before we proceed. We
can then send an invoice once your order has dispatched, with 30 day terms. Is there a specific email address we should
use for the invoice?
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I hope this helps. 

Kind regards

Sophie Lines

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone calls to the main office will be answered, but please
continue to use email where possible. 
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Emailsophie.lines@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542
Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582
Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer
-----------------
The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.
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If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542
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On Thu, Nov 14, 2024 at 2:03 PM Ruohonen Toni <toni.ruohonen@hus.fi> wrote:

Hi,

 

do you require payment before shipping?

 

In HUS we cant pay anything before shipping.

 

is this ok for you?

 

Ystävällisin terveisin

Toni Ruohonen

Ostaja / Buyer

 

HUS, Runkopalvelut, Materiaalinhallinta

PL 441, 00029 HUS | Uutistie 5, Vantaa

Toni.Ruohonen@Hus.fi
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Lähettäjä: Sophie Lines <sophie.lines@viamed.co.uk>
Lähetetty: keskiviikko 13. marraskuuta 2024 16.39
Vastaanottaja: Ruohonen Toni <toni.ruohonen@hus.fi>
Aihe: Re: Hus price inquiry

 

Good afternoon, 

 

Thank you for your email. I can confirm the price for part number 2520000 (Microstim DB3 Patient Lead) is €20.70 EXW.
If you would like to place an order, I can send you a Proforma Invoice which will include the carriage costs via UPS as
well - just let me know how many you require.

Kind regards

Sophie Lines

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone calls to the main office will be answered, but
please continue to use email where possible. 
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On Wed, Nov 13, 2024 at 2:00 PM Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> wrote:

 

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: Ruohonen Toni <toni.ruohonen@hus.fi>
Date: Wed, 13 Nov 2024 at 13:53
Subject: Hus price inquiry
To: medica@viamed.co.uk <medica@viamed.co.uk>

 

Hi,

 I would like to know the price of a following item:

   Tuotetiedot Hinta
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Huomaathan, että viesti on tullut HUSin ulkopuoliselta lähettäjältä. Avaa mahdolliset linkit ja liitteet
vain, jos olet varma lähettäjästä.

Huomaathan, että viesti on tullut HUSin ulkopuoliselta lähettäjältä. Avaa mahdolliset linkit ja liitteet
vain, jos olet varma lähettäjästä.

 

 

Mikrostim DB3 Patienti Lead 0.9m- Press Stud|18 puntaa/kpl|REF: 2520000

 

 

 

Ystävällisin terveisin

Toni Ruohonen

Ostaja / Buyer

 

HUS, Runkopalvelut, Materiaalinhallinta

PL 441, 00029 HUS | Uutistie 5, Vantaa

Toni.Ruohonen@Hus.fi

 

 

 

15/11/2024, 10:55 Gmail - VS: Hus price inquiry

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=d104de5290&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f:1815616111873934315%7Cmsg-f:1815784891784495… 4/4

https://www.google.com/maps/search/Uutistie+5,+Vantaa?entry=gmail&source=g
mailto:Toni.Ruohonen@Hus.fi

