14/11/2024, 10:03

M Gmail

Gmail - Re: Payment details

Re: Payment details

1 message

Sudath Weeraman <sudathweeraman17@gmail.com>
To: Kate Giriffiths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>

Good morning Kate,

I am sorry for the late reply,

Please arrange MAX-250E Oxygen sensor order separately,
The reason is very difficult to do custom clearance in Sri Lanka especially medical products, | hope you understand

Thank you
Best Regards,

Sudath

Prime Lanka Associate

Sri lanka

Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

14 November 2024 at 09:48

On Wed, 13 Nov 2024, 10:27 pm Sudath Weeraman, <sudathweeraman17@gmail.com> wrote:

Hi Kate,

No not include the R-42v order

Please arrange separate order for MAX-250E order

Best regards
Sudath..

On Wed, 13 Nov 2024, 9:30 pm Kate Griffiths, <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

Hi Sudath,

Before | do this new order, do you want me to include it in your order as follows?

Your Viamed Contact for this Order Confirmation : kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk

Iltem Reference

0110042
PAYPAL

EXW

Kind regards

Kate Griffiths

rsey

Order Confirmation CVM153322

EXW Ex Works Viamed, UK * Incoterms(R) 2020

Description Quantity Unit

Viamed Oxygen Sensor R-42V 5 34.00
PayPal Account : paypal@viamed.co.uk 1 10.20
Delivery: EXW - Viamed, UK (Incoterms 2020) 1 0.00

Consigned to:

Sky Cargo express

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

Total

170.00

10.20

0.00
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