06/11/2024, 10:34 Gmail - Fwd: Offer EyeMax2

M Gmall Sophie Lines <viamed.sophie.lines@gmail.com>

Fwd: Offer EyeMax2

1 message

Ryan Swaine <ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk> Wed, Nov 6, 2024 at 10:17 AM
Reply-To: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
To: Kate Griffitths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>, Aqib Majeed <agib.majeed@viamed.co.uk>, Sophie Lines <sophie.lines@viamed.co.uk>

Please amend their order and add the free items.
Thank you, Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

--- Forwarded message ---------

From: Nadia Gémez [Admon. Sorevan] <nadia.gomez@sorevan.com>
Date: Tue, 5 Nov 2024 at 18:13

Subject: RE: Offer EyeMax2

To: <ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk>

Cc: <imports@sorevan.com>

Hi Ryan

Thank you for the information. Please send me a proforma invoice for the following quantities

Reference Description Quantity
R300P01 EYEMAX 2 REGULAR 32 A 38CM 3.000
R300P02 EYEMAX 2 PREEMIE 26 A 32CM 3.000
R300P03 EYEMAX 2 MICRO 20 A 26CM 1.000

Best regards

R

= TIMANT - Nadia Gémez

Dpto. administracion / Backoffice

Mambar of

SOREVAN

MEDICAL SOREVAN, SL
C/ Puerta de Abajo, 18. Pol. Ind. Alpedrete - 28430 Alpedrete (Madrid)
TIf: (+34) 91 850 10 58 - Fax: (+34) 918 514 824

nadia.gomez@sorevan.com - www.sorevan.com

(&) No me imprimas si no es necesario. Protejamos el medio ambiente.

Este mensaje de correo electrénico y cualquier archivo adjunto que lo acompafie es para su uso exclusivo de las personas o entidades a las que esta dirigido y puede ser informacién confidencial y/o privilegiada.
Las opiniones expresadas en este mensaje no son necesariamente las opiniones de Medical Sorevan. La compafifa, sus directores, ejecutivos o empleados no afirman ni se responsabilizan por la exactitud o el caracter completo de la

informacion a menos que se declare expresamente lo contrario. Aviso legal

This email and any attachments are intended solely for the use of the individual or entity to whom it is addressed and may be confidential and/or privileged. The views expressed in this email are not necessarily the views of Medical

Sorevan, and the company, its directors, officers or employees make no representation or accept any liability for its accuracy or completeness, unless expressly stated to the contrary. Legal advice

Valore la atencién recibida AQUI

@O

oo

De: Ryan Swaine <ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk>
Enviado el: martes, 5 de noviembre de 2024 16:05

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=d104de5290&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f:1814886951506372400%7Cmsg-f:1814967899004552... 1/3


http://www.viamed.co.uk/
mailto:ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
http://www.viamed.co.uk/policy
mailto:nadia.gomez@sorevan.com
mailto:ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
mailto:imports@sorevan.com
http://www.timant.co.uk/
http://www.timant.co.uk/
https://www.google.com/maps/search/C%2F+Puerta+de+Abajo,+18?entry=gmail&source=g
mailto:nadia.gomez@sorevan.com
http://www.sorevan.com/
http://es.linkedin.com/company/medical-sorevan?trk=top_nav_home
http://es.linkedin.com/company/medical-sorevan?trk=top_nav_home
https://www.sorevan.com/aviso-legal/
https://www.sorevan.com/aviso-legal/
https://goo.gl/forms/nvXrsfM5vNzwJUF63
https://goo.gl/forms/lwN1HpIaIt0D4Bt53
https://goo.gl/forms/lwN1HpIaIt0D4Bt53
mailto:ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk

06/11/2024, 10:34

Para: Nadia Gdmez [Admon. Sorevan] <nadia.gomez@sorevan.com>
CC: mns <mns@sorevan.com>
Asunto: Re: Offer EyeMax2

Hi Nadia

| hope you're well.

Gmail - Fwd: Offer EyeMax2

I wanted to inform you that until 22/11/24, Maxtec is offering a “Fall Eyemax 2 Promo” where they will provide 10 boxes of EyeMax free of charge for every 100 boxes of the

same type purchased.

To align with this, we would like to extend a slightly enhanced offer: Order 10 boxes and receive 1 additional box of the same type free of charge.

This offer is available until 21/11/24.

Would you like to adjust your order before we include the complimentary items in your proforma invoice?

| look forward to your response.

Best regards
Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542

Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Tue, 5 Nov 2024 at 12:51, Ryan Swaine <ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

Thank you very much Nadia

One of my colleagues will be in contact very soon with a proforma invoice.

Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542

Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Mon, 4 Nov 2024 at 16:08, Nadia Gomez [Admon. Sorevan] <nadia.gomez@sorevan.com> wrote:

Dear Ryan

Please send me a quotation for EyeMax2 light therapy glasses in the following quantities:

Reference Description

R300P01 EYEMAX 2 REGULAR 32 A 38CM
R300P02 EYEMAX 2 PREEMIE 26 A 32CM
R300P03 EYEMAX 2 MICRO 20 A 26CM

| look forward to your reply.

Quantity

2.300
2.000
640
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Best regards

Momber of ﬁ TIMANT " Nadia Gémez
Dpto. administracion / Backoffice

SDH EVAN MEDICAL SOREVAN, SL

C/ Puerta de Abajo, 18. Pol. Ind. Alpedrete - 28430 Alpedrete (Madrid)
TIf: (+34) 91 850 10 58 - Fax: (+34) 918 514 824
nadia.gomez@sorevan.com - Www.sorevan.com

B No me imprimas si no es necesario. Protejamos el medio ambiente.

Este mensaje de correo electrénico y cualquier archivo adjunto que lo acompafie es para su uso exclusivo de las personas o entidades a las que esta dirigido y puede ser informacion confidencial y/o privilegiada
Las opiniones expresadas en este mensaje no son necesariamente las opiniones de Medical Sorevan. La compafiia, sus directores, ejecutivos o empleados no afirman ni se responsabilizan por la exactitud o el caracter completo

de la informacion a menos que se declare expresamente lo contrario. Aviso legal

This email and any attachments are intended solely for the use of the individual or entity to whom it is addressed and may be confidential and/or privileged. The views expressed in this email are not necessarily the views of

Medical Sorevan, and the company, its directors, officers or employees make no representation or accept any liability for its accuracy or completeness, unless expressly stated to the contrary. Legal advice

Valore la atencién recibida AQUI
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