05/11/2024, 13:31 Gmail - Fwd: Offer EyeMax2

M Gma" Sophie Lines <viamed.sophie.lines@gmail.com>
Fwd: Offer EyeMax2

1 message

Ryan Swaine <ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk> Tue, Nov 5, 2024 at 12:50 PM

Reply-To: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
To: Kate Giriffitths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>, Agib Majeed <aqib.majeed@viamed.co.uk>, Sophie Lines <sophie.lines@viamed.co.uk>

Hi, please can send a proforma invoice.

1114005 = 115
1114006 = 100
1114007 = 32

Thank you

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Nadia Gémez [Admon. Sorevan] <nadia.gomez@sorevan.com>
Date: Mon, 4 Nov 2024 at 16:08

Subject: Offer EyeMax2

To: <ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk>

Cc: mns <mns@sorevan.com>

Dear Ryan

Please send me a quotation for EyeMax2 light therapy glasses in the following quantities:

Reference Description Quantity
R300P01 EYEMAX 2 REGULAR 32 A 38CM 2.300
R300P02 EYEMAX 2 PREEMIE 26 A 32CM 2.000
R300P03 EYEMAX 2 MICRO 20 A 26CM 640

| look forward to your reply.

Best regards

%

rember of “ke TIMANT ™ Nadia Gémez

Dpto. administracion / Backoffice
SDH EVAN MEDICAL SOREVAN, SL

C/ Puerta de Abajo, 18. Pol. Ind. Alpedrete - 28430 Alpedrete (Madrid)
TIf: (+34) 91 850 10 58 - Fax: (+34) 918 514 824

nadia.gomez@sorevan.com - www.sorevan.com

T
.

(& No me imprimas si no es necesario. Protejamos el medio ambiente.

Aviso legal
Legal advice
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