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M Gmall Agib Majeed <viamed.aqib.majeed@gmail.com>

Fwd: quote request TL1064935

Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> 4 November 2024 at 14:36
To: Agib Majeed <aqib.majeed@vmsecure.me.uk>

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Leidos-TVS-James.Brown <James.Brown568@teamleidos.mod.uk>
Date: Mon, 4 Nov 2024 at 14:06

Subject: quote request TL1064935

To: sales@viamed.co.uk <sales@viamed.co.uk>

Good Day,

WITHOUT COMMITMENT

Team Leidos have a requirement for the following item detailed below:

6135993388286

9V ALKALINE BATTERY

TL1064935
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You are requested to submit a firm price and delivery (P&D) offer.

Gmail - Fwd: quote request TL1064935

Please supply quote on official headed paper ensuring the following information is provided:

NATO Stock Number(s).
Quantity.

Lead-time
Product Shelf Life
Date of Quotation Expiry

Price is to be Carriage Paid. Delivery charge must not be shown separately unless agreed.
Price to be exclusive of VAT
Price to be quoted in Pounds Sterling

The Tenderer shall note that delivery is of the essence and is requested to state their best delivery offer.

Delivery to be made to the following address and must be conforming to commercial packaging/labelling in accordance with the Team Leidos Supplier

Manual. For ease of reference, this can be found at https://www.leidos-supply.uk/supplier-manual.

Kuehne & Nagel Ltd
MEDLOC

DFCA1

Hortonwood 50
Telford

Shropshire
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If you have any queries regarding the Price and Delivery enquiry, please do not hesitate to contact the undersigned.

It is requested that you respond to this quotation request within two working days or inform the undersigned if longer is required.

Please confirm receipt of this e-mail. Thank you.

Kind Regards,

James Brown

Medical Delivery Team

TVS Supply Chain Solutions Ltd
Bristol | UK
M +447867254761

W tvsscs.com / SCIP

This email and any attachments transmitted with it are confidential and intended solely for the use of the individual or entity
to whom they are addressed. If you have received this email in error, please delete it and notify the sender. Unless
explicitly stated otherwise, the views in this email are personal and may not reflect those of the company. This email is not
intended to be contractually binding. Before acting on this email or opening any attachments, you should read our privacy

policy.

This email and any attachments have been scanned for the presence of computer viruses. TVS Supply Chain Solutions

Ltd accepts no responsibility for computer viruses once this email has been transmitted.

© TVS Supply Chain Solutions Limited (Company No 02748952) is a trading subsidiary of the TVS Mobility Group.

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=07ddd72f30&view=pt&search=all&permmsgid=msg-f:1814803016076010000&simpl=msg-f: 1814803016076010000&mb=1 3/4



11/4/24, 3:11 PM Gmail - Fwd: quote request TL1064935

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=07ddd72f30&view=pt&search=all&permmsgid=msg-f:1814803016076010000&simpl=msg-f: 1814803016076010000&mb=1 4/4



