
Sophie Lines <viamed.sophie.lines@gmail.com>

Re: MVM152907
1 message

Shaun Turton <shaun@cryoserve.co.uk> Tue, Oct 29, 2024 at 9:16 PM
To: Sophie Lines <sophie.lines@viamed.co.uk>

Hello Sophie 

Thanks for your email and information supplied , I can confirm payment has been made using the link supplied 
Please send the items once they become available to the following address 

Mr  Shaun Turton
1 Flouch Mews 
Hazlehead 
Sheffield 
S36 4AA

Hopefully this helps and is what is needed to progress this order 
Thanks again for your help and support 

Regards 
Shaun Turton 
07739146842

Sent from my iPad

On 22 Oct 2024, at 09:37, Sophie Lines <sophie.lines@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

Dear Shaun, 

Thank you for your email. Emily is not in the office today, so please accept my reply.

Please use the following link in order to make payment for your Proforma MVM152907, which totals £869.76:

https://square.link/u/Se3GAhzp 

If you have any problems, please do not hesitate to contact us.

Kind regards

Sophie Lines

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone calls to the main
office will be answered, but please continue to use email where possible. 

http://www.viamed.co.uk
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On Tue, Oct 22, 2024 at 9:11 AM Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> wrote:

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: Shaun Turton <shaun@cryoserve.co.uk>
Date: Mon, 21 Oct 2024 at 20:05
Subject: Re: MVM152907
To: Emily Morton <emily.morton@viamed.co.uk>

Hello Emily 

Thankyou for taking my call earlier today and sending across the pro forma and send me the link for
payment as mentioned 

Please accept this email as i wish to proceed 

Please despatch as soon as they arrive as I have customers waiting for work to be completed 

Best Regards

Shaun Turton

<ABB63807-0A7F-4286-8B28-40989717B531.tiff>

T: +44 (0) 7739146842
E: shaun@cryoserve.co.uk
W: www.cryoserve.co.uk

This message contains confidential information and is intended only for the individual(s) named above.  If you are not
the named addressee(s) or the person(s) responsible for delivering the message to the named addressee(s), you
should not disseminate, distribute or copy this e-mail without the prior written consent of the sender.  Please notify
the sender immediately by e-mail if you have received this e-mail by mistake and delete this e-mail from
your system.  If you contact us by e-mail, we will store your name and address to facilitate communications.

On 21 Oct 2024, at 11:03, Emily Morton <emily.morton@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

Good morning Shaun,

Further to our phone call earlier please find attached your proforma, if you would like to
proceed please let me know and i will send you a link to pay via Square.

Please note we currently do not have these sensors in stock, they are due into the warehouse
week commencing 4th November, if they do come in any earlier we will ship them out asap.

Please do let me know how you would like to proceed.

Kind regards

Emily Morton
Office Administrator
Viamed Ltd.
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