10/29/24, 9:28 AM Gmail - Fwd: Order n. 212 - 2024

M Gma" Aqib Majeed <viamed.aqib.majeed@gmail.com>

Fwd: Order n. 212 - 2024

Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com>
To: Agib Majeed <agib.majeed@vmsecure.me.uk>

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Amministrazione FISICA Unifi <amministrazione@fisica.unifi.it>
Date: Mon, 28 Oct 2024 at 14:52

Subject: Order n. 212 - 2024

To: <info@viamed.co.uk>, Pietro Ricci <pietro.ricci@unifi.it>

Good morning,
in attach we send you our purchase Order n. 212 - 2024 and your Quotation

Below | write you some administrative instructions:

- Please address supply and invoice to:
DIPARTIMENTO DI FISICA E ASTRONOMIA
Universita degli Studi di Firenze

Via G. Sansone, 1

CAP 50019 - Sesto Fiorentino (FI) - ITALY
VAT number: IT01279680480

28 October 2024 at 15:44

- Please fill and send back the order confirmation, the self declaration checks, the dichiarazione Tracciabilita CC

- Please write the following data on your invoice that are required from ltalian Law:

CIG code: B40156D12C
CUP N° B93C21000890006

Number of Commodity Code o Customs tariff for Customs purpose.
Thank you for your kind cooperation and best regards.

ceoe

Universita degli Studi Firenze

Dipartimento di Fisica e Astronomia

Via G. Sansone, 1 - 50019 Sesto Fiorentino (FI)
Ufficio Acquisti

Beatrice Giusti Tel. +39 055 4572086

Matteo Lupocchi Tel. +39 055 4572088

www. unifi.it
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