
Sophie Lines <viamed.sophie.lines@gmail.com>

Fwd: New order
1 message

Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> Thu, Oct 24, 2024 at 9:15 AM
To: Sophie Lines <sophie.lines@vmsecure.me.uk>

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: Medmech <Admin@medmech.com.au>
Date: Wed, 23 Oct 2024 at 22:38
Subject: New order
To: info@viamed.co.uk <info@viamed.co.uk>
Cc: orders@viamed.co.uk <orders@viamed.co.uk>

Hi there, 

We purchased an Envitec oxygen analyzer from you back in 2021 and are after a replacement oxygen cell.

Model - OOM111 

I've attached which I hope is the correct one, could I please arrange and invoice for payment so this can be sent? We are
located in South Australia.

Thankyou.

Kind regards

Aaron Feeney
Medmech solutions
0412513685

Image.jpeg
412K

24/10/2024, 09:40 Gmail - Fwd: New order

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=d104de5290&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f:1813782472812038303%7Cmsg-f:1813782472812038… 1/1

mailto:Admin@medmech.com.au
mailto:info@viamed.co.uk
mailto:info@viamed.co.uk
mailto:orders@viamed.co.uk
mailto:orders@viamed.co.uk
https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ui=2&ik=d104de5290&view=att&th=192bd98c97ca889f&attid=0.1&disp=inline&realattid=192bd97e4761e1bed3b1&safe=1&zw
https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ui=2&ik=d104de5290&view=att&th=192bd98c97ca889f&attid=0.1&disp=inline&realattid=192bd97e4761e1bed3b1&safe=1&zw

