17/10/2024, 15:16 Gmail - Re: new order

M Gma" Ryan Swaine <viamed.ryan.swaine@gmail.com>

Re: new order
1 message

acquisti.elettronica@nemo-srl.com <acquisti.elettronica@nemo-srl.com> 17 October 2024 at 15:13

To: ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk

Hi Ryan,

Thank you for the update. Please proceed with the purchase of the 50 sensors and arrange for shipment as soon as possible.

Could you kindly send me the updated proforma so | can proceed with the payment?
| have a delivery for the military market, and timing is crucial.
Thank you for your understanding.

Best regards,
Francesco

I 17/10/2024 14:52, Ryan Swaine ha scritto:
Hi Francesco

Regarding your potential order, | currently have 50 sensors available in stock. If you require 100, | may be able to
fulfil this in approximately 7—10 days, but | would need a couple of extra days to confirm.

Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

General Manager

VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk

Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900

Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

On Thu, 17 Oct 2024 at 10:23, acquisti.elettronica@nemo-srl.com <acquisti.elettronica@nemo-srl.com> wrote:
Hi Ryan,

| hope you're doing well. | wanted to check in and see if you have any updates for me regarding the quantity and
the delivery times.

Looking forward to hearing from you.

Best regards,
Francesco

Il 16/10/2024 10:31, Ryan Swaine ha scritto:

Hi Francesco

The price would not be affected by the quantity. Please give me until later today to see if we can
make any improvements on the delivery time.

Best regards
Ryan

Ryan Swaine

General Manager

VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk

Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
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Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900
Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

On Wed, 16 Oct 2024 at 07:34, acquisti.elettronica@nemo-srl.com <acquisti.elettronica@nemo-
srl.com> wrote:

Hi Ryan,
Thank you for your prompt response and for sending the proforma invoice.

| have a couple of questions regarding the order. If we reduce the order to 50 pieces, would the
unit price still remain at £38? Also, would it be possible to improve the lead time and deliver
sooner than 6 weeks? The products are quite urgent for us, but splitting the shipment into two
deliveries would increase our costs significantly due to customs fees.

Therefore, | would prefer to place a smaller order now and schedule another for an additional 50
pieces later. | look forward to hearing your thoughts.

Best regards,
Francesco

Il 15/10/2024 17:43, Ryan Swaine ha scritto:
Hi Francesco
Thank you very much for your order.

Please find your proforma invoice attached. Our bank details are listed on the
invoice, or | can send you a link if you'd prefer to pay by card.

Regarding the lead time, it could take up to 6 weeks. However, | may be able to
rearrange some orders or provide a part shipment if it's urgent, please just let me
know.

I look forward to hearing from you.

Best regards
Ryan

Ryan Swaine

General Manager

VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk

Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900

Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

On Tue, 15 Oct 2024 at 14:12, acquisti.elettronica@nemo-srl.com
<acquisti.elettronica@nemo-srl.com> wrote:
Hi Gail ,

I would like to order n°100pcs of oxigen sensor R-22VAN.
can you send me the proforma?can you also tell me about the delivery time?

Best regards

Francesco

Nemo srl
Via Vetturini 22/24, 58024
Valpiana - Massa Marittima - Italy

Francesco

Nemo srl
Via Vetturini 22/24, 58024
Valpiana - Massa Marittima - Italy
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