10/11/24, 10:37 AM Gmail - Fwd: proforma invoice add items

M Gmall Agib Majeed <viamed.aqib.majeed@gmail.com>

Fwd: proforma invoice add items

Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> 11 October 2024 at 09:14

To: Agib Majeed <agib.majeed@vmsecure.me.uk>

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Bmg Equipment <bmg.equipment@gmail.com>
Date: Fri, 11 Oct 2024 at 06:49

Subject: Re: proforma invoice add items

To: Kate Giriffiths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>

Dear Kate,

many thanks for e-mail. @

please add in P.I

SpiroTrue H - Single use flow sensor Box of 6 , Ref. 1030132000 ........... 4 boxes ( total 5 boxes )

B.r
Anastasios

21 10-Oct-24 4:42 PM, o/n Kate Griffiths £ypawe:
Good afternoon Anastasios,
Thank you for your email.

Please see attached quotation as requested. If you would like me to proceed, please let me know. | can
then change the quotation to a confirmed order.

These are currently in stock.
Kind regards
Kate Giriffiths

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office.
Telephone calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use email where possible.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.
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If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to
be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please
reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Thu, 10 Oct 2024 at 13:16, Bmg Equipment <bmg.equipment@gmail.com> wrote:

Dear Kate,

hello! &

Please send us P.I for:

nr. Part number Description Quantity
1 0110560 OOM111, O2 sensor Compatible for Envitec MySign O Oxygen equipment 1 pc
2 0110023 Compatible for Draeger Evita 2 / 4 Oxygen equipment 8 pcs
3 4310009 SpiroTrue A Flow Sensor for hamilton REF:1030132000 1 Pack (6 pcs)

Best reqards

Anastasios

2116 17-Jul-24 2:01 PM, o/n Kate Griffiths éypawe:

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=07ddd72f30&view=pt&search=all&permmsgid=msg-f:1812604661979559844&simpl=msg-f:18126046619795598...

Good morning Anastasios,
Thank you for your email.

Regarding the O2 sensor for CPAP Medin Sindi, please could | ask you for details or
pictures of the sensor, then | can advise you further.

The prices and availability are as follows:
Part number 0110560 - R-23V €73.95 each EXW. These are currently in stock.
Part number 0110023 - R-23V €35 each EXW. These are currently in stock.

Part number 4310009 - SpiroTrue H - Single use flow sensor, box of 6 €39 each EXW.
The are currently in stock.

Part number 4310007 - SpiroTrue A - Single use flow sensor, box of 5 has the following
price breaks:

[1=€120.00 [[10=€60.00 [[25=€55.00 [100=€50.00 [[250=€45.00 |

These are currently in stock.

Part number 4310008- SpiroTrue A (PC) - Autoclavable flow sensor, box of 5 has the
following price breaks:

[1 =€ 150.00 [[5 = €90.00 [[10 = € 82.50 [[25 = € 75.00 |
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These are currently not in stock.

Please let me know if | can be of any further assistance.
Kind regards

Kate Griffiths

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and
in the office. Telephone calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use
email where possible.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.
If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action
taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our
mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Wed, 17 Jul 2024 at 08:54, Bmg Equipment <bmg.equipment@gmail.com> wrote:
Dear Kate, Catrin
Hello from Greece !!
Please inform us about price and delivery time for :
1) 02 sensor for CPAP MEDIN SINDI
2) 02 sensor 0110560
3) 02 sensor 0110023
4) SpiroTrue H Flow Sensor , Part Number: 4310009
5) SpiroTrue Flow Sensor A, Part Number: 4310007
6) Flow Sensor A(PC) Hot-wire Anemometric Flow Sensors , Part Number: 4310008
Thanks in advance
B.R

Anastasios
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