
Ryan Swaine <viamed.ryan.swaine@gmail.com>

Re: Requirement of Sensors
1 message

Amphitrite Subsea <mail@amphitrite-subsea.com> 26 September 2024 at 03:36
To: ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk

Good Day Ryan,

Please note the delivery address is - 

Harishankar Nair
C-23 0-1 Palm Beach Society, Sector 4, Nerul, Navi Mumbai, Maharashtra, India 400706

Regards,
Hari

On Tue, Sep 24, 2024 at 3:17 PM Ryan Swaine <ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk> wrote:
Dear Harishankar

Please find your proforma invoice attached. 

Please check the address details and let me know if there are any amendments required. 
Please let me know if you are happy to proceed and I will have the sensors put into production. Our bank details are
listed on the proforma invoice, but I can send you a payment link if you would prefer to make a card payment.

Best regards
Ryan

Ryan Swaine
General Manager
VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk
Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900
Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

On Mon, 23 Sept 2024 at 17:31, Amphitrite Subsea <mail@amphitrite-subsea.com> wrote:
Good Day,

Hope you all are doing well.

Would appreciate if you could please let us know the rate and delivery schedule of the below mentioned products
- 

1. PPO2 Analyser (Analox 100 HYP MKlll) sensors - R-33 Van Vandagraph x 4 Nos
2. O2 Analyser G22 Sensor R33 Van-2 x 6 Nos
3. O2 Analyser Sat System Sensor R22 Van Vandagraph x 3 No

Warm Regards,

Harishankar Nair
Director
Amphitrite Subsea Pvt Ltd
Mumbai
+919892288443
+918591289538
mail@amphitrite-subsea.com
www.amphitrite-subsea.com

26/09/2024, 09:27 Gmail - Re: Requirement of Sensors

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=7e81c75fe0&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f:1811005134716272051%7Cmsg-f:18112244110821322… 1/1

mailto:ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk/
mailto:ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
mailto:mail@amphitrite-subsea.com
mailto:mail@amphitrite-subsea.com
http://www.amphitrite-subsea.com/

