9/25/24, 12:08 PM Gmail - Re: oxygen sensor

M G ma II Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

Re: oxygen sensor
1 message

Neumo Formosa <neumofsa@gmail.com> 25 September 2024 at 02:07
To: Kate Griffiths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>

Delivery address:

Name: BRINGIT IMPORT LLC
Address: 3513 NW 82 nd Ave
City: Doral

State: Florida (FL)

ZIP: 33122-1094

Country: United States

Phone number: +17868042224

Invoice Address:
Concejal Vargas 1231
Asuncion

ZIP Code: 001405
Paraguay

El vie, 20 sept 2024 a las 12:52, Kate Giriffiths (<kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>) escribio:
Sorry, | am unable to create a proforma invoice without both addresses. | need the delivery address to be
correct so that the carriage charge is correct.

Kind regards
Kate Griffiths

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office.
Telephone calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use email where possible.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to
be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please
reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=b587 1a5be0&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f:1810005522503793842%7Cmsg-f:1811128190184305615&...  1/7



9/25/24, 12:08 PM Gmail - Re: oxygen sensor

On Fri, 20 Sept 2024 at 16:49, Neumo Formosa <neumofsa@gmail.com> wrote:
With the billing address could you now make the invoice?

El vie, 20 sept 2024 a las 12:10, Kate Griffiths (<kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>) escribié:
Sorry for the misunderstanding. | am unable to create a proforma invoice without addresses, so | will
do so when | next hear from you.

Thank you for the clarification.
Kind regards
Kate Griffiths

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the
office. Telephone calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use email where
possible.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or
omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list,
please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Fri, 20 Sept 2024 at 16:06, Neumo Formosa <neumofsa@gmail.com> wrote:
| haven't sent them yet because they haven't confirmed them. We're not going to use that address.

El vie, 20 sept 2024 a las 11:52, Kate Griffiths (<kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>) escribio:

| still cannot see the addresses? Are you able to send them with your reply? You mentioned
shipping to Miami, and | also asked you to confirm the invoice address as:
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