9/25/24, 11:18 AM Gmail - Re: Purchase order number E1/230924

M Gma” Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

Re: Purchase order number E1/230924

1 message

Piotr Podkowa <piotr@oxylink.pl> 25 September 2024 at 11:15
Reply-To: piotr@oxylink.pl
To: Kate Griffiths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>

Thanks Kate. Please go ahead.

Pozdrawiam serdecznie / Best regards,

Piotr Podkowa

OXYLINK

Mobile: +48 509701509

8r., 25 wrz 2024, 12:11 uzytkownik Kate Giriffiths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk> napisat:
Thank you Piotr,

Sensor type: R-22VA (single version) 0110039 date code is May/June 2024. In stock

Qty: x20
2.
Sensor type: R-41V 0110041 date code is April 2024. In stock
Qty: x20
. Contact Name : Piotr Podkowa
Delivery Address Invoice Address Contact Tel - 0048509701509
Oxylink Piotr Podkowa Oxylink Piotr Podkowa (Euro)
Groszowice 343 Groszowice 343 Account 00007883
Woj Mazowieckie Waoj Mazowieckie Customer Reference  E1/230924
;;.ér[‘g‘;_LEtn‘Sko ;E_é?]lg_LEthkn DE_ﬂe 25 Sep 2024
Poland Poland Priority 8
VAT PL7962334181
Priced In Euros
Order Confirmation CVM152427 Page 1

EXW Ex Works Viamed, UK * Incoterms{R) 2020
Your Viamed Contact for this Order Confirmation : kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk

ltem Reference Description Quantity  Unit Unit Vat Total
0110182 Oxygen sensor - Automotive R-22AVG 100 19.75 1,875.00
Tariff 9027109000
CoO United Kingdom
0110039 Viamed Oxygen Sensor R-22VA 20 32.00 640.00
Tariff 9018209000

CoO Germany

0110041 Viamed Oxygen Sensor R-41V 20 32.00 640.00
Tariff 9019209000
CoQ Germany

EXwW Delivery: EXW - Viamed, UK (Incoterms 2020) 1 0.00 0.00
Consigned lo:

UPS account number: 074VF3

Total Net: 3,255.00
Total Vat 0.00
Total: 3,255.00

Are you happy for me to do a confirmed order? | will ask the warehouse to ship this week.

Many thanks.

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=b5871a5be0&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f: 18111553534 14628204 %7 Cmsg-f:1811162734479804736&... 1/5



9/25/24, 11:18 AM Gmail - Re: Purchase order number E1/230924
Kind regards

Kate Griffiths

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office.
Telephone calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use email where possible.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted
to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please
reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Wed, 25 Sept 2024 at 10:40, Piotr Podkowa <piotr@oxylink.pl> wrote:
Dear Kate,

Please add to this order as follows:

1.
Sensor type: R-22VA (single version)
Qty: x20

2.
Sensor type: R-41V
Qty: x20

Same order number E1/230924. Could you please make sure it will all go out this week?
Pozdrawiam serdecznie / Best regards,

Piotr Podkowa

OXYLINK

Tel.: 509 701 509

E-mail: piotr@oxylink.pl
Web: www.oxylink.pl

sr., 25 wrz 2024 o 11:06 Kate Griffiths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk> napisat(a):
No problem Piotr,

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=b587 1a5be0&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f: 18111553534 14628204 %7Cmsg-f:1811162734479804736&...  2/5



9/25/24, 11:18 AM Gmail - Re: Purchase order number E1/230924

Cathy is on holiday this week, so if you email me | can make any changes. (I am off on Friday, but
emails to orders@yviamed.co,.uk can be accessed by the team).

Kind regards
Kate Griffiths

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the
office. Telephone calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use email where
possible.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or
omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list,
please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Wed, 25 Sept 2024 at 09:35, Piotr Podkowa <piotr@oxylink.pl> wrote:
Dear Kate,

Could you please few hours. | will add more sensors to this order
Pozdrawiam serdecznie / Best regards,

Piotr Podkowa

OXYLINK

Mobile: +48 509701509

8r., 25 wrz 2024, 10:33 uzytkownik Kate Griffiths <kate.griffiths@yviamed.co.uk> napisat:
Good morning Piotr,

Thank you for your order.

The dates codes for these is July and August 2024.
Am | ok to proceed with your order?

Many thanks.

Kind regards

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=b587 1a5be0&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f: 18111553534 14628204 %7Cmsg-f:1811162734479804736&...  3/5
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Gmail - Re: Purchase order number E1/230924

Kate Griffiths

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in
the office. Telephone calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use
email where possible.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.
If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken
or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing
list, please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Wed, 25 Sept 2024 at 09:19, Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> wrote:

---------- Forwarded message ---—------

From: Piotr Podkowa <piotr@oxylink.pl>

Date: Mon, 23 Sept 2024 at 07:45

Subject: Purchase order number E1/230924

To: Cathy Green <cathy.green@viamed.co.uk>, <orders@viamed.co.uk>

Dear Cathy,
Please supply as follows:

1.

Sensor type: R-22AVG
P/N: 0110182

Qty: x100

on order number E1/230924.
Pozdrawiam serdecznie / Best regards,
Piotr Podkowa

OXYLINK

Tel.: 509 701 509
E-mail: piotr@oxylink.pl

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=b5871a5be0&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f: 18111553534 14628204 %7 Cmsg-f:1811162734479804736&...
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Web: www.oxylink.pl

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=b587 1a5be0&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f: 18111553534 14628204 %7Cmsg-f:1811162734479804736&...  5/5



