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RE: PCR240329
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Javier González López [SAT SOREVAN] <jgl@sorevan.com> 23 September 2024 at 13:55
To: Kate Griffiths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>

Dear Kate,

 

Please find attached the amended order with price.

Regarding de max-550E, it is which we need, it is to use in maxblend2

 

Please let me know the eta, because we need R125P02-011 urgently.

 

Best regards

 

 

Javier González López
Director Servicio Técnico /Technical Service Manager

MEDICAL SOREVAN, SL

C/ Puerta de abajo nº 18 . Pol. Ind. Alpedrete · 28430 Alpedrete (Madrid)

Tlf: (+34) 91 850 10 58 · M (+34)636976603 Fax: (+34) 918 514 824
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De: Kate Griffiths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>
Enviado el: lunes, 23 de septiembre de 2024 13:07
Para: Javier González López [SAT SOREVAN] <jgl@sorevan.com>
Asunto: Re: PCR240329

 

Good afternoon Javier,

 

Thank you for your order PCR/240329.

 

Regarding part number 0110454, there are two versions of the MAX-550E. 

0110454 (R140P02-001) is a Max-550E for use with MaxBlend devices (MaxBlend 2, MaxBlend Lite
and Blender Buddy 2).  It is supplied complete with a special flow diverter which is narrower in
diameter and has a small bleed hole (0120086).

 

0110454 are not currently in stock. 

 

As there are no prices mentioned on your PO, please see snip below showing pricing.  Carriage will be
added at time of invoice as usual.

 

If you reply to say you accept the prices, I will make your order into a confirmed order.  I would let you
know the lead time as soon as I have that information.
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Kind regards

 

Kate Griffiths

 

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

 

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

 

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

 

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the
office. Telephone calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use email where
possible.

 

E-mail Disclaimer

-----------------

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or
omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

 

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list,
please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

-----------------

 

 

On Mon, 23 Sept 2024 at 10:52, Javier González López [SAT SOREVAN] <jgl@sorevan.com> wrote:

Dear Catrin,
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Please find attached a new order for Sorevan.

 

Please could you let me know the estimated delivery time.

 

Bets regards

 

 

 

Javier González López
Director Servicio Técnico /Technical Service Manager

MEDICAL SOREVAN, SL

C/ Puerta de abajo nº 18 . Pol. Ind. Alpedrete · 28430 Alpedrete (Madrid)
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