20/09/2024, 09:14 Gmail - Re: order

M Gma" Sophie Lines <viamed.sophie.lines@gmail.com>
Re: order

1 message

Jonas Klara, MUDr. <Klara.Jonas@vfn.cz> Thu, Sep 19, 2024 at 3:43 PM

To: Sophie Lines <sophie.lines@viamed.co.uk>

Good afternoon,
Thank you for your reply.
Please find the invoice and shipping information below:

Invoice Information: Nadaéni fond Vita et futura Hlohovd 2094/50 106 00 Prague 10, Czech republic, 1CO:
26183234 Bank account: 2061621029/5500

Shipping Address: Mgr. Olga Stajnrtova, Apolinaiska 18, 128 08 Nové Mésto, Prague, Czech Republic
We kindly request a proforma invoice detailing carriage and insurance.

Thank you for your help, and we look forward to receiving the proforma invoice.

Best regards,

Klara

0d: Sophie Lines <sophie.lines@viamed.co.uk>
Odeslano: ¢tvrtek 19. zari 2024 15:24

Komu: Jonas Klara, MUDr. <Klara.Jonas@vfn.cz>
Pfedmeét: Re: order

Tento e-mail pfiSel z externi e-mailové adresy. Dbejte prosim zvySené opatrnosti pfi jeho otevirani.

Good afternoon,

Thank you for your email. | can confirm the prices for the items you require are as follows:

¢ 0120399 - 'T' adapter. 22mm I.D. - 22mm O.D. Reusable (non-autoclavable) Pack of 5 - 27.00 EUR per pack
e 0120099 - Oxygen Sensor Flow Diverter 15 mm Includes O ring. M16 thread to 15 mm O.D. Allows insertion into a T-
adapter with a 15 mm I.D. port - 7.00 EUR each

Please can you provide me with the delivery and invoice addresses, so | can send the Proforma Invoice which would include

carriage costs to you via our UPS courier.

Kind regards
Sophie Lines
Please note: My working days are Tuesday, Wednesday and Thursday

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone calls to the main office will be
answered, but please continue to use email where possible.

http://www.viamed.co.uk
Emailsophie.lines@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542
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Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
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The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be
unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535
634542

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Thu, Sep 19, 2024 at 9:18 AM Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> wrote:

—————————— Forwarded message ---------

From: Jonas Klara, MUDr. <Klara.Jonas@yvfn.cz>
Date: Thu, 19 Sept 2024 at 08:17

Subject: order

To: orders@viamed.co.uk <orders@viamed.co.uk>

Dear Sir or Madam,

I hope this email finds you well. | would like to place an order for the following items:

* Product code: 0120399 (1 piece - Pack of 5)
* Product code: 0120099 (5 pieces)

Unfortunately, | was unable to complete the order through your online shop as it does not support shipping
to the Czech Republic. Could you please assist me by sending a proforma invoice for the above products
along with the shipping cost?

Once | receive the invoice, | will proceed with the payment as soon as possible.
Thank you in advance for your assistance. | look forward to your reply.
Kind regards,

Klara Jonas, MD
Tel.number: +420602504067
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