
Sophie Lines <viamed.sophie.lines@gmail.com>

Fwd: Order
1 message

Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk> Thu, Sep 19, 2024 at 9:15 AM
To: Sophie Lines <sophie.lines@vmsecure.me.uk>

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: Георги Боянов <amelideood@abv.bg>
Date: Thu, 19 Sept 2024 at 07:31
Subject: Order
To: <office@viamed.co.uk>

Dear colleagues,

I want to order part number 0110049 - Oxygen Sensor R-49V - 15 pieces

Here I want to explain something because last time there was misunderstanding. 

We have two companies. They are Amelid and Inversa

Owner by documents of Amelid is Georgi Boyqnov
Owner by documents of Inversa is Atanas Lazarov

Amelid is mainly for service and repair
Inversa is for sales 

Please, when you prepare invoices, they have to be to Inversa.

Company data: 
Name: Inversa LTD
VAT: BG204956745
Address: 118 Haidushka gora str, Sofia, Bulgaria
Owner: Atanas Lazarov
Sipping address: 118 Haidushka gora str, Sofia, Bulgaria

AMELID LTD

Bulgaria, Sofia 1614

35 Madzharica str.

+359887370730
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